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affodil Fete 
Hlond, blue-eyed Carol Pa­

rcheta · was named Franklin 
Pierce Daffodil Princess ear­
ly last week during the first 
evening program held at the 
school to select a Daffodil 
Festival queen candidate, b 

Previous selections were 
made during an afternoon tea, 
and attended by a small group 
of parents, faculty, and stu­
dents. 

An estimated 600-700 per­
sons turned out to see viva­
cious Carol win the nod of the 
judges. Proceeds from ticket 
s a I e s netted the Franklin 
Pierce Daffodil Committee 
$500 to start construction of 
the district's float, finance 
chairman Sam Harris stated. 

The 1967 Franklin Pierce 
princess is the 17 year old 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Edwin Parcheta, 9920 Waller 
Road. She has a 3.2 grade 
point average and hopes to 
attend Western Washington 
State College next fall. Her 
ambition is to become an ele­
mentary school teacher or a 
child psychologist. 

"l love to dance," the new­
ly crowned princess told the 
Herald, and listed ballet and 
school activities as her pri­
mary interests. She was 
elected a cheer leader by 
fellow students, and serves 
O).l the fashion advisory board 
of a Tacoma department 
store, 

The five princess finalists 
gave a 3 minute prepared 
speech on the subject "The 
Place of a Woman in Today' s 
World," then answered two 
questions pertaining to school 
and family. 

"Since the time of pioneer­
ing, it has been difficult for a 
woman to maintain her femin­
ity," Carol told the audience. 
11 But she always welcomed a 
masculine hand to help her 

into the buggy." Speaking of 
today's world of equal rights 
for women Carol said, 11 No 
matter what her ambitions, as 
long as she maintains her qua­
lity of feminity, she is always 
a woman." 

"A woman is a human being 
and so much more, 11 Becky 
Youngblood stated and quickly 
added, "Even if she seems un­
organized." She emphasized 
the woman' s role in helping 
with the family income by say­
ing, 11 The old adage two can 
live as cheaply as one doesn't 
seem to work anymore." 

Wendy Leavitt, 18, describ­
ed today's woman as 11 Con­
remporary as an IBM comput­
er and as traditional as apple 
pie,11 She outlined the duties 
of a modern wife at home, in 
Church, and in the community. 
Tracing the evolution of mod­
ern woman from pioneer days 
Wendy said, "Women are for­
ever changing, yet forever the 
same." 

Cindy Walkup, 17, sawafew 
disadvantages in being a wo­
man, but pointed out women 
have the right to take emotion­
al advantage, Despite emo­
tions, women are as cool as a 
cucumber when going into the 
maternity ward, she stated. 

Predicting men can expect 
keener competition from the 
fairer sex, 18 year old Pam 
Peterson said modern woman 
is no longer ku st a 11 kitchen 
slave". "The age of jet 
planes and modern freeways 
often puts mother in charge 
of the family while father is 
away. She is a household 
maintenance engineer, can be 
found carrying petitions for 
sewer annexations, or coach­
ing a sandlot ball game, 11 Pam 
stated. 

Woller Grange 

To Mork 2 nd 

Anniversary 
WALLER ROAD - County 

Commissioner Harry Sprink­
er will be guest speaker for 
the 22nd birthday anniversary 
of Waller Road Grange at B 
p.m. Friday in the Waller Roacl 
Grange Hall. 

Sprinker was one of the or­
ganizers of the Grange when it 
was founded Feb., 1945, At 
that time he was Pierce County 
Pomona Master. 

'TI1e public is invited an­
nounced Master James Tay­
lor, Lecturer Mrs, Rudolph 
Geise has arranged a program 
and home economic chairman 
Mrs. H.E. Lovell will present 
a decorated birthday cake. 

Herald To Publish 
Early Next Week, 
Deadlines Change 

'TI1e Pierce County Herald 
will publish Tuesday next week 
instead of Wednesday because 
of tl1e Washington's Birthday 
holidaj. b 

Classified and display ad­
vertising de<!dlines w i 11 be 
moved to noon on Saturday. 
Social news deadline will be 
noon Priday. 

Parkland 
Clean-Up 
Group Meets 

The Parkland Clean - Up 
Committee met at the home 
of chairman Ray Manges Feb­
ruary 2 to pbn Clean-Up Day, 
the annual event in which the 
Parkland citizens band toge­
tl1er in beautifying the com­
munity. 

The fourth annual Clean-Up 
Day will be held May 6. 

Recruiting chairman Hank 
Hctle, is appealin1~ to local 
fraternal organiz;irions, car 
clubs, churches, schools and 
university organizations, the 
Grange, the 4-11 Club, busi­
nesses and the Boy and Girl 
Scouts to participate. 

Last year one hundred tons 
of refuse were removed from 
the Parkland area. 

'TI1is year a special effort 
will be made to remove aban­
doned automobiles from the 
roadways. 'TI1ere is a county 
ordinance concerned with the 
possession of sn·ippeLl auto­
mobiles for the purposes of 
selling parts, 

Area leaders arc needed to 
help organize the event, Any 
ci~izen interested maycontact 
Ray Manges at LE 1-0671 or 
Al McManis at LE 7-:J953. 

"The function of tliis pro­
gram is to arou~c a civic re­
sponsibility of every citizen 
in the Parkland area," said 
J olm K. Hartsell, hist year's 
chairman. "Our community 
must have the entire support 
of both its adult and youth ci­
tizens to prog;ress." 

Eatonville Schools 
Pick Anatone Supt. 
To_ Replace Olson 

EATONVILLE - Henry 
Charbonneau, presently sup­
erintendent of schools atAna­
tone, Washington, has been 
named to succeed H.C. Olson 
as superintendent of School 
District 404, Eatonville. b 

The 52 - year - old veteran 
sch o o 1 administrator was 
elected at the February 6 
meeting of the Eatonville 
school board. 

Charbonneau and his wife 
have eight children, two of 
whom will be in elementary 
school, two in high school and 
four in college when he as­
sumes his duties. 

1 The new superintendent has 

I. held similar po. sts for tlie past 
20· years in ~.Iiams, Minn., 

711 

Adin, Calif., and lnchelium, 
Wishram and Anatone Dis­
tricts in Washington. I-le has 
also 10 years' experience as 
a classroom teacher, includ­
ing four as a Naval officer 
with educational duties. 

Charbonneau holds a bache­
lor's degree in education from 
Wisconsin State University 
and a master's degree from 
the University of Iowa • He 
also has done further gradu­
ate work at the University of 
California at Berlceley. 

In addition to his adminis­
trative duties, Charbonneau 
has served on state curricul­
um and music committees and 
headed various teacher and 
·superintendent· organizations. 
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Signed Sections 
Large Enough 

• or Se er 1st. 
PARKLAND - 11ic five ar­

eas which have been accepted 
by SoutJ1 Suburllan Sewer Dis­
trict commissioners include 
enough potential customers 
for an economically sound dis­
trict operation, president 
Clayton B. Peterson said this 
week. 

The Commissioners acted 
to annex four more areas at 
th:cir rncetin:•; f'ebruary7. l'c­
titions represcntin)~ n1ore than 
60 per cent or tile~ land owner­
sl1ip or ilreas II, III, IV. and 
VI were recd ved, accepted 
ant.1 forwarded to the County 
Con11nissioners. 

These petitions include the 
land from lOOth Su-eet South 
along Pacific to !23rd Street 
and lhm1 l 'onia nd on !:ht' Fast· 
to Sheridan on the West and 
from Yakima to Spanaway 
Loop Road from Tulc Lake 
l{oad north. 

ln order to sell the revenue 
bonds needed to finance the 
inrerceptor and disposal sys­
tem, a sewer . district must 
prove to the bond buyers that 
sufficient revenue can be gen­
erated to pay off the bonds, 

A group of land owners met 
Sunday to begin solicitation 
in Arca Vil which includes tl1e 
land from the Freeway north 
to 96th alon1', A Street. Two 
ot:l1er groups arc working to 
estalllish petitions in otl1er 

areas contiguous to those al­
ready established. 

Peterson spoke to a meet­
ing of the Midland Commu­
nity Club last week. Almost 
LOO people turned out to re­
ceive information and discuss 
problcms of securing sewers 
in the Midland area. 

At: this meeting, Pet:;rson 
pointc:cl out that the South Su­
burban Sewer District's Com­
prehensive Plan was estab­
lished to ser·vc all areas in 
the southern part of Pierce 
County that need and want 
sewers. 

' 1111c sewer district is a 
legally constimtcd municipal 
entity. Therefore it must be 
prcparccl to serve the inter­
ests of all people in the area 
who desire service. The fact 
tl1at only cenain areas have 

'been annexed tlms far dues not 
eliminate any area from an­
nexation and sewer service. If 
60 per cent or more of the land 
ownership in any area want to 
join tl1e sewer district we will 
be happy to annex them." 

The Commissioners will 
move ahead witl1 further steps 
for achieving . an operative 
sewer system as soon as the 
necessary legal hearings be­
fore the County Commission­
ers are completed, 

Henry Charbonneau 
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150 >From County Chosen 
For Sprlng Jury Duty 

More <than 150 Pierce Coun­
ty vdrers were drawn this week 
by County Clerk Don Perry for 
jury duty during the. March ' 
and A.pril session of superior 
court; b 

Among those who will report 
to Judge .Bartlett Rummel in 
presiding court for ins.truction 
and assignment at R:30 a.m. 
March l are: 

Hele.n 1. Allen, 5332 s. ls 
DJ:"., Sumner; .· L.E. Bagley, 
J{t. 5, Box 282, Puyallup; Ef~ 
fie H. .Ball, 413-.5th St. N,E,; 
Frank P. Bisig, 1347-lSth St. 
N, w., Puyallup; Chas. Blick­
enderfer, Jr., 335 - 17th St. 
N.W,, Puyallup; Henry Boul­
top,. l\t· ~'. Box 49 2; .Fra11ces 
Brigham, 45!7•127th; Murry 
I-I, )3uck, Rt, 2, Box 97, Sum­
ner; Morris L. Calloway, 813 
Thompson St., Sumner; Leo 
Campbell, 625 Benston Dr., 
Puyallup; Emma j, Chafe, 11-
224 ASt.;LelaChristo[forson,. 
7316 East 90; Beatrice Clark, 
R.t. 1 Box 64, Sumner; c. 
Richard Coe, Rt. 1, Box 144, 
Sumner; Arlene E. Crabtree, 
1717-3rd Ave.N,W.; Puyallup; 
Viola DeLoria, 8310-43rd Pl.; 
fy'.lel~in M, Denny, !Ol(ilGrebe 
Rd., Puyallup; Robert R. Doe-. 
hler, 508 So. 133; Vencil H. 

Dudacek, 602-16th St. S,E., 
Puyallup. 

Rosemary w. Earl, Rt. 6, 
Box 806; Henry Edmondson, 
Rt. 2, Box 350, Sumner: El­
mer T, Erickson, Kapowsin; 
Julia Eshpeter, 9412 E, Mon­
roe; Angelo J7elaschi, Rt. 6, 
Box 764, Puyallup; Orvil E, 
Gates, 10021 Ea. Polk; Nor­
man D, George, 821-1 Sth St. 
S. W,, Puyallup; Barb a r a 
Green, 823-lSth St. S. W., l'uy­
allup; Harold. R. I laguc:, 619 
1/2 -10th St. S.E., Puyallup; 
Arline 0 0 Ilall, 2510 Valley 
Ave., Puyallup; J',!1;1. llall, 
6008, Gay, Puyallup; Louise 
Imhof, Rt. I, Box 224, Buck­
ley; James Itami, Rt. 1, B.ox 
128.-A, Su1i1ncr; 

Vera M, Jacobsen, 44'!-!0th 
Ave. S.E., Puyallup; Janet T. 
j angard, 4303- 43rd Ave. E., 

', Puyallup; Lorraine .Jching, 
4201 Ea· 101; Carol A. .John­
son, Rt. 3, Box 14.15 , Sum­
ner; Helen Johnson, Rt. l, Box 
154.'\, Buckley; Mary B. John­
son, 907 So. 117; McrcdH:h 
Jungck, Rt. 1, Box 585, Sum­
ner: Jack L. Kendall, 3114So. 
88;Vernon A. Kershner; 7606 
Delano Rd., Puyallup; Ralph l\ 
Lacrosse, Rt. I, Box 233, 
Orting; Raymond G. Lamp­
shire, 916-13th St; s.w., Puy­
allup; .Viola G. Marcoe, 9610 
Ea. 122, Puyallup; Wesley E. 
McKiUip, 1026-14tlt St. S, W,, 
Puyallup; Merle I', McMullen, 
1206 W. Main, Puyallup;Elma 
M, Milotte, Rt. 2, Box 1150, 
Sumner; Richard w. Morrio>h, 
Rt. 1, Box 170, Graham; Win­
fred Naper, 11604 Waller Rd.; 
Cecil Neighbors, 1625.so. 104; 
Norman S. Nute~ 8925 E. Tay­
lor; Isidor Ochsner, Rt. 3, Box 
2220, Sumner; ponald V. Ol­
son, Rt. 3, Box 344, Tacoma; 
Est11er. Olson, 176 East Tule 
Lake, Road; George A. Olson, 
10811-34th Ave. E;; Margamt 
Olson, General Delivery, Dash 
Point. 

George Plesha, 617 w. 
Main, Sumner; John I', Por­
ter, 505-15. Ave. S.E., Puy­
allup; Budd Pound.• Rt. 6, Box 
491; Herman C:, Rappubn, 306-
9th Ave, S.E., Puyallup; Don­
ald M. Reed, .3 l2'-.3rd St. S.E., 
l;'uyallup; Tony Repik, 8812 
Taylor' St.; Ralph w. Roberts, 
i0719"".128th St. E., Puyallup; · 
Hilliar.ct H. Rudolph, 812-Sth 
~t. S.E., Puyallup; Hazel Run­
ning, P,O. Box 283, Parkland; 
Jessie Sartain, McKenna; 
Burton H. Severeid, 311East 
!27th; James Sparling, Rt. 2, 
Box .1766,. Puyallup; Donald R. 
Still, . 610 So. 115th; Ge()rge 
R. Teeple, Jr., 14009 So. N; 
Leona M. Turney, 1415 w. 
Pioneer, Puyallup; Vera N. 
Wade, 17016. 32nd Ave. E.; 
Cal-I Wagenblast, 1216 So. 114; 
Harvey L, Waterhouse, 4310 
21st St. N,E,, Puyallup; Lois 
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OLYMPIA - The dispute 
over ocean beach jui"isdiction 
between Land Commissioner 
Bert Cole and State Parks 

Director Charles .Odegao.rd 
has been settled as far as 
Republican Governor Dan Ev­
ans and the Demo<:ratic Lea­
dership in the Senate are con­
cerned. 

An executive request mea­
sure designed as a compro­
mise has been introduced in 
the Senate under sponsorship 
of Robert Bailey, Senate maj­
ority caucus chairman; Gordon 
Sandison, another key Democ­
rat, and Joe Chytil, Chehalis 
Republican. Neither side is 
getting all it wants, but even if 
neither side is satisfied, the 
measure probably \'/1ll pass, 
with both t11e Governor and 
part of the Democrati~ .lead­
ership supporting it. 

DIVIDED CONTROL 
'I11e measure would estab­

lish a Washington State Sea­
shore Conservation Area un­
der direction of the State 
Parks Commission below ac­
creted lands. 'I11e Department 
of Natural Resources, under 
Cole, would retain manage­
ment of the accreted lands. 
'I11e Parks Department could 
negotiate with Natural Resou­
rces for limited uplandpro­
pcrty on which to huHd rest 
rooms, picnic tables, parking 
facilities and other basic nec­
cssitic s, but not11ing t11at would 
compete with private resorts. 

The I' arks Commission 
could also establish reason­
able ·.traffic control orr beach 
lliti;hWays-, -bllt; driving would 
still be permitted, subject to 

restrictions imposed by t11e 
f)cpartmerrt of Fisheries for 
protection of clam beds. Nor­
mal jurisdiction, incidentally, 
would he retained by all de­
partments, such as Fisheries, 
Game etc., [or performance of 
current duties. 

OUT IN Tl IE COLD 
Probably the mos.t frust­

rated group around Legisla­
tive halls these days is com­
posed of the counties.Forgot­
ten stepchildren in tl1e scram­
ble for state financial aid, 
they have apparently been th­
warted in t11eir attempts to 
get a share of tl1e 2-mill pro­
perty tax which is collected 
by t11e state. This money is 
now earmarked for public as­
sistance and even law-makers 
who recognize the counties' 
needs are wary of repercus­
sions should they divert part 
of the millage to the counties. 

Some Democrats have criti­
cized Governor Evans' propo­
sal to make $25 . million in 
state money available to the 
cities because there aren't any 
provisions for county govern­
ment. 

GAS TAX ON BLOCK 
If the gasoline taX is in­

creased t11is session, it will 
require a lot of horse trading. 
There arcn' t enough legisla­
tors in either house who are 
inalterably opposed to a boost 
to block it. However, nearly 
every legislator who would 
be willing to vote for a hike 
has some strings tied to his 
vote. He would vote for a gas 
tax increase 11 if'' the high­
way budget includes a cer­
tain project for bis district 

E. Whited, McKenna; Victor S. 
Williamson, Rt. 1, Box 29, 
Sumner; Theodor.e R. With- : 
row, 1033 E, Main, Puyallup; 
Clarence Wood, 126-lSth St. 
S.E., Puyallup; Arthur J, · 
Woodfeldt, 616-llth St. S.E •• ' 
Puyallup; Don Yager, 359-A,' 
Spanaway; Lorene York, 19302 1 
193 Ave. E,, Sumner. \ 

Co111111llly Police Be~I ' 

Narc'otic·s---Users Caught 
After Gas Station Stop 

By Em Matson 

and 11 if'' that project is plac­
ed reasonably high on the prio­
rity list. .It would take a pret­
ty big tax hike to finance the 
pro jeers ·nee de d to muster 
enough support to pass the 
bill. Discussion of the size 
of the increase ranges from 
1 1/2 to 2 1/2 cents a gallon. 

Representative Al Leland, 
chairman of t11e House Trans­
portation Commit1.ee, is spon­
soring a bill which would boost 
the tax 2 1/2 cents, which 
would raise the total state 
tax to 10 cents a gallon. , 

BOND ISSUE SOUGHT 
Leland's bill authorizes a 

$200 million bond issue, which 
would be retired over a 
25-year perJod from one cent 
of t11e gas tax. One cent 
would go for consmtction of 
city and urgan arterials and 
the half-cent now allocated 
to cities would be retained. 
Of the remaining 7 1/2 cents, 
a quarter would be earmark­
ed for ferry subsidy, as at 
pmsent, and !lie remaining 
7 1/2 cents would be appor­
tioned among state, counties 
and cities. The state's per­
centage of this money would 
be increased over the present 
allocation formula, however, 
while the counties' and cit­
ies' shares would be reduc­
ed, percentagewise. 

LIQUOR 
A bill to refer a Sunday li­

quor prohibition bill to tl1e 
people, introduced in the 
!louse, and one which would 
require t11e Liquor Control 
Board to ban liquor sales one 
day a week, which was intro­
duced in the Senate, have be­
come great conversation piec­
es, butthat1 sasfarastheywill 
go. These are tl1e things for· 
which ten-foot poles are made. 
111e majority of tl1e legisla­
tors are just as reluctant to 
consider bills which would 
tighten our liquor laws as they 
were to liberalize t11em before 
repeal of the blue laws. When 
it's all over, the Liquor Con­
trol Board will have to settle 
the Sunday liquor issue wit110ut 
any help from the Legislature. 

Investigation of a report that 
a man was lying unconcious in 
a Parkland service station 
restroom led to the arrest of 
a pair of 24 year old narcotics 
users late last week, Sherif fl s 
Detective Ward Archer re­
ported. b 

One of the pair suddenly 
went into convulsions, then 
passed out after taking a" fix" 
in the service station rest­
room, Archer stated. His bud­
dy asked the station attendant 
to calta,n _ambulance, but when 
he heard the Sheriff's office 
had been notified, he loaded 
the limp man into his car and 
drove off. 

As Deputy Sheriff Charles 
A. Klingenberg was inspecting 
blood-stained paper towels 
left by t11e men, the station 
attendant spotted the vehicle 
used by the pair heading north 
on Pacific Avenue. Deputy 
Klingenberg stopped the ve­
hicle near 110111 and Pacific 
and took the men into custody. 
A small bottle o[ narcotics 
was found in rhe car. 

'I11e stricken man was treat­
ed at Mt. View County Hospi­
tal. Be admitted shooting a 
near letl1al overdose into his 
system, Archer di~closed. 
TI1e victim told officers he 
had lost track of how many 
"fixes" he had taken. , 

"I'm glad I was caught," 
one of the men confessed, 
"Now maybe I can get some 
help to shake this addiction." 

Both suspects had numer­
ous needle scars on their 
a<ms, Archer said. One of the 
men had been using drugs 
steadily the past 4 or 5 years. 

Both were charged with ille­
gal possession of .narcotics. 
Bail was set at $2500 in judge 
Filis Otto• s court. 

PUYALLUP - B.urglars 
kicked in the .t'ear door of 
Boyle Oil Co.mpany, 239 15th 
Street:'·,S,E,· to steal $17 in 
cash; . p~lice reported Friday 
night. 

'TI1e smashed door was dis­
covered by a police patrol 
unit and officers at the scene 
reported the door jamb had 
been split from top to bottom. 
A cash register drawer was 

found on tl1e floor near the 
rear door. 

PUYALLUP - Burglars en­
tered the Valley Market, 501 
Valley Ave. N,E., Puyallup 
recently to steal $77. 40 in 

You're Ccdling the Right 
Number for True Savings 

'62 CHEV Impala hdtp. . ... , .. , ... , , , . , , , .. 
'62 CHEV Impala hdtp. , , .... , . , , , .... , . , . , 
'63 CHEV Monza Spyder .. , . , .. , . , ... , .... . 
'63 OLDS 88 4-dr. sedan , .. , , . , , , , ........ . 
'63 CHEV Impala hdtp. , .... , , , . , .. , , ..... . 
'63 BUICK LeSabre hdtp. . ....... , .. , ..... . 
'63 FORD Country Squire 9-pass. wagon .... . 
'63 FORD Ranch Wagon ........... , ...... . 
'64 CHEV Impala hdtp. . ...... , ........... . 
'64 RAMBLER 660 wagon ............ , ... . 
'64 OLDS F-85 wagon ..... , ....... , ..... , . 
'64 FORD Galaxie hdtp. . ....... , ... , .... , , , 
'65 RAMBLER 660 wagon , ... , .. , , . , . , , , , , 
'64 PONTIAC Grand Prix hdtp. , .. , .. , , . , , , , 
'64 PONTIAC Catalina wagon .... , . , . , . , , .. 
'65 CHEV Bel Air sedan . , .... , , .. , . , , , . , .. 
'65 CHEVELLE de luxe sedan . ,',,.,., .. ,, .. 
'65 CHEV Impala hdtp. . .. , . , .. , ..... , , .. , . 
'65 RAMBLER 550 sedan ..... , ... , ... , ... . 
'65 RAMBLER 330 sedan .......... , .. , .... . 

"COME SEE US" 

ANDY EGAN 
RAMBLER 

$1,280 
1,345 
1,090 
1,370 
1,495 
1,460 
1,490 
1,280 
1,695 
1,495 
1,590 
1,565 
1,795 
1,995 
l,790 
1,695 
l,690 
1,980 
1,440 
1,380 

8223 P'adf ic: Ave .. GI .. 4 .. 9404 
OPEN MON. AND FRI. TILL 9 P.M. 
TUES., THURS., SAT. TILL 6 P.M. 

merchandise, Sheriff's Depu­
ties reported. 

A dozen and one half car­
tons of cigarettes, 11 cases 
of beer plus eight 6-packs 
were listed as missing. Enrry 
was gained by prying the hasp 
off the front door. 
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is prepared to make fou very happy. 

JURKEY'~":· i!~ ... I. 

ARMOUR'S STAii PAN SIZED SLICED DUMGIENIESS 

COOKED CRAB 
USDA 
GRADED 
CHOICE 
Bl.ADE 
CUT 
BEH IENERS .. LB. 

FRUIT DRINK. !f,.~·. 
BURSHEJ'S CHOCOLATE 

ORSELS •• ::t ••• 
PLYMOUTH 

ARGARINE I !B. 
CTNS •. 

• • • • 

OHAN 
fllESll 

l 
I 
if 

• • • 

I I 
PRICES I ' 

EFFECTIVE : I 
FEB. 15-16-17- 18 I l 

RIGHT TO LIMIT : : 

IS RE.SERVED : I 
I WITHOUT COUPON •..• ,89C l 
I B : . . . . . . . : 
L------·------------------·-·• 

PACIFIC PHRI. TINY 

¢1$H RI MP •r:~2 oz. 
Ill • Ill •••• 

DARIGOlD 

¢1BUTTER •• @ • ~~~. 
BANQUIET FROZEN AU VARIETIES EXCEPT HAM 

HDINNERS ••• c:Ac:. HARVEST RIPE ELBERTA ~1 
PEACHES ... . ":':"'. _. 77

1
: iiLUAiU COuPON: 

CANNEDMILK.!~;~ .• tl9: .... -- SAVE 20~ : 
•. · . . ·. . LARGE EGGS .. LYNDEN GRADE A •••• ooz.43¢ I • WASHTEX- I 

~~,!!!!~. '~'~'EESE. -~~:":~ •• 79~ ~~.EAM SAN DWI CH •• ::~ •• 59t : B l E 
ICE CREAM •••• ~·.:•;; ••• .19~ HERSHEY BARS ••• :·;" • ••• 29t I 
.HALl.EYS . . TRIPLt 59"' PILLSBURY 39,1. I 
POTATO CHIPS •• ::c:.. . ,. PIE CRUST MIX ••• ':0

;;. • • ,. 

. BUMBLE BEE NO. I 69"' POL AR I RESH 10 6/89"' I REG. 49~ 
PINK SALMON ••• !'";. • • ,. FROIEN VEGETABLES:''~ ,. I 

ANGEL FOOD CAKE MIX ••• fl:'. • • • ,. I r"""''°' "" 79"' GAL. LEJ JU ( E CifEii'nv PIE FILLINGS ••• ~:-: ••• 39t : wn• •••s couPO• 

CALIF. 
CRISP 
FRESH 
HEADS Van de Kamp·s 

SPECIALS 

EFFECTIVE FEB.15-16-17-18 VAN~ON GER MAH OiOC, SPICE:, 49~ II 
( 

llll ll!lll!Q!I PECAN, FUOGE Ill 
111\1&.Jt o e e e o e o o • 

JIFFY 10 . CORN MUFFIN MIX "" "". ' " I 
HONEY DATE MIX • "'· , 
BISCUIT MIX ""'· """"' , """ .,,2 I 

CASH VALUE.1120 CENT 

PARKLAND. STORE ·oin. Y 

---

I 
I 

. I 
~ I 

I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 

BEAR CLAWS 
PKG. 3· gc 
OF 4 

OP~Et.f 

9AM· 
10 Pf'.1 
DAILY 

CHERRY PIE 

ONLY 59c 
·fa·n Be Kflm~s~: 

IBAl<fRl(S JM 

I 1 

PACIFIC AVE. AT GARFIElD 
PARKLAND 
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SELECTING HOME FURNISHINGS will be the topic of a series of meetings March 6, 
7 and 8 at Puyallup, Parkland and University Place sponsored by the Pierce County 
Cooperative Extension Service. Home furnishings specialist with the Extension Ser· 
vlce at Washington State University Mrs. Dorothy Chase (center) will counselpartici· 
pants in a vari~ty of topics to make their homemore attractive. Color, furniture and 
floor coverings willbe on the agenda' in each of the three two-hour classes. Registra. 
tion until the Marc,h I deadline can be accomplished through the Extension Service by 
calling County Agent Bernice Belshaw, FU 3-3311, Ext. 511. -- WSU Photo. 

DaUocm',lloyaHy 

9. Princesses To Be Greeted By Board 
Nine "princesses of spring',' I 

will be presented to the Puy­
allup Valley Daffodil Festi­
val board of directors Thurs­
day'. evening in Anton's Res'­
taurant, mid "'. way between ; 
Puyallup and Sumner. b i 

Candidates for the title of 

queen of the 1967 Festival, I 
Aprill-9, will be, , introduced. 
They will appear in their new 
spring yellow-and-white for- i 
mals// 
mals. 

For the royal court it will 
mark their third get-together 
of the week. Monday night 
princesses and their ,parents 
met with members of the roy- : 
airy committee in lvan' s Res­
taurant on the River Road, for 
indo, ctrination. Wednesda, y af-1 
ter school d1ey, went through 
an intensive "charm school" ' 
in Tacoma. 

Festival activity took on a 
11 youth look" when 75 student 
body leaders from nine high 
schools in the area were 
guests ar a festival-sponsored 
11 coke party''. 

The initial sessic>n for high 
school leaders was held in the 
Winthrop Hotel to acquaint 
students with the soon-to-be­
launched festival booster but­
ton drive, Buttons will go on 
s a 1 e February 27 throughout 
"Daffodil Land". 

Tickets for the seconcl Daf­
fodil, Special train ride to the 
daffodil fields April 2 are 
now on sale. Tickets for both 
adults and children may be 
purchased at the Daffodil Fes­
tival office, Hotel Winthrop, 
care of the Tacoma Chamber 
of Commerce; Union Station, 
Tacoma; NPRR ticket offices 
in Puyallup and Aberdeen; and 
Puyallup Valley Chamber of 
Commerce offices, Puyallup. 

Sale of the tickets for the 
train ride will end March 24th. 

EVERYTIUNG GOES UP •••• 1nn WIE HAVE DROPPED PRICH! 

2495 62 Chev lmpalla 
Conv. was 1295 

65 GALAXI E 500 Hard J 995 62 Gal ax. 500 XL 
Conv ... was 1295 

1995i 62 Pont. Grand 
Prix ... was 1395 

1395 61 Mercury 4 dr. 
.... was 895 

11951 6J Falcon St. Wgn. 
·, .... was 495 

1545\, 60 Chev Impala 

1195\ 
H.T. was 795 

60 Corvair 

16501 .... was 595 

60 T-Bird 
1250\ ... was Jl9S 

'12501 
60 V.W. Micro 

7~0! Bus ... was 795 

1195 
S9 Rambler Amer. 295 .... was 395 

59 Ford 2 Dr. 450 1350 •••• was 495 

59 Olds St. Wgn. 450 795 ...was 495 

58 Rambler 195 
450 

95 51 Desoto 

7501 
195 56 Olds 

4951 

56 Desoto St. Wwi. 295 
1150. 53 Jeep 795 

, NEW 1/2. TON 
S 1995 Road ready plus tax and license, 
105-H.P. 6 cyl. why buy a little 4 qi 

I _import. GAS? 23 to 24 Mi. _!>er Gal. 

USED TRUCKS 
62 l'2 Ton f"ord 
6 cy_I_~ over' dri V'> 

60,V.M. 
.Micro Bui;, 
601'> Ton 
Ford 6 cyl. 

59 Ford I-ton 
Flat Bed'_ 

1295 58,lnter. 
_ · Yi-Ton'. 

79,5 57 \12 Ton. ~ord 
C.O. mat1c 

7,95 56 \12 Ton Ford 6 cyl. 
GOOD ONE: 

1095 53, Chev. 
, 3/4 Toni 

56 W2 Ton lntn. 
Flat Bed 1 

695 
595, 
695, 
350, II 
695 

TOTEM FOLK DANCERS 
will ,meet at 7:45 p.m. Friday 
in the South Park Community 
Center, SOth and S. Tacoma 
Way. Dances will be raught 
by Richard G, Norton. Pre­
ceding the classes Patricia 
Mogensen will have a dance 
class for Girl Scouts, For in­
formation call the Norrons or 
Mrs. Harry Carens. Specra-

.• ors are welcome. 

* * * 
ELK PLAlN GRANGE will 

meet, 'at 8 p,m. Monday. Mem­
bers are asked to bring a 
friend. ,A bake sale will be 
held fof the 11 Heart Fund." 

*' * * 
SPECIAL SERVICES will be 

he,ld, twice daily, 10:00, a.m. 
and ,7:30 p.m.. February 19 
through 26, at Parkland First 
Baptist Church, 112th and" J" 
Street, the pastor, Don Kim­
brough annourrced today. 

The evangelist, jack Stuart, 
is now serving as Secretary 
of the Training Union Depart­
ment, of the Baptist General 
Convention of Oregon-Wash-
ington. 

*** 
SUMMIT NURSERY School 

mothers ,will meet at 8 p.m. 
Tuesday in the Canyon Com­
munity Hall. Gue st speaker 
w i 11 be psychologist Mrs. 
Margaret Keblbeck of the Ta­
coma Public S,chools. She will 
speak on "The Development 
Stages of Early Childhood"• 
Plans will also be made for a 
field trip for the children to 
the County Humane Society. b .... 

GRAHAM FIREMEN'S Help­
ers of Graham District #21 
Fire Station will have an open 
house meeting at 7:30 p.m. 
Thursday for all area women. 
Special entertainment and re­
freshments will highlight the 
evening. TI1ose attending are 
asked to bring Betty Crocker 
coupons and Hi Ho grocery 
receipts. b 

* •• 
TACOMA WRITER'S Club 

will meet at 8 p.m. Tuesday 
in rl1c Allied Arts Building. 
Featured, speaker will be Se­
attle photographer and writer 
Margaret Marshall. She will 
present awards for this year's 
articles contest. b 

• * * 

Clyde Hoovers 

To Mark 25th 
Wedding Date 

SPANAWAY -An open house , 
will be held from 2 to 5 p,m I 
Sunday in the home of Mr.and' 
Mrs. Clyde Hoover in honor of 
their silver wedding anniver­
sary. 

All friends and neighbors 
are invired to call during the 
afre:rnoon. Host and hostess 
will be their daughter and 
son-in-law Mr. and Mrs.Gary 
Timmons and son Clyde. 

Mr. and Mrs. Hoover v.ere 
married on Valentine's Day, 
19 42 in the Eatonville Melho­
dist Church. 

Special guests at the open 
house will be honored couple's 
wedding attendants Mrs. Bar­
ney Malcom andLeonardCou­
tch. 

FIEST A for all Girl Scours 
of the Parkland - Spanaway 
area will begin at 6 p.m. Fri­
day at Keithley Junior High 
School, ! 23rd and South L. 
Each troop, in costume, will 
present entertainment and sell 
articles and foods of the coun­
try they represent. All pro­
ceeds will be given to the Ju­
liette Lou Friend ship Fund 
which enables girls of all Girl 
Scout nations to attend inter­
national events throughout the 
world. 

*** 
CONCERT by tl1e 25th Air 

Division Band will begin at 8 
p.m. Monday in Bethel Junior 
High School. The band is dir­
ected by CWO Herb Childs. 
Refreshments will be furnish­
ed by Clover Creek parents 
and served by Marcia Podi­
man and Carla and Sandra 
Nelson. Admission is free. 

*** 
CITIZEN'S MEETING will 

be held 8 p.m. February 15 at 
the James Sales Grange Hall 
to discuss the pending County 
Services Bill currently being 
considered by the Washington 
State Legislature. b 

*** 
FRUITLAND DRILL TEAM 

will exemplify the third and 
fourth degrees at 8 p.m. 
Thursday at the James Sales 

Grange Hall. All candidates 
are expected to attend. h 

.... * 

MERRY MIXERS Square and 
Round Dance Club will dance 
Saturday evening at Graham 
Grange Hall to the calls of 
Joe Hall of Seattle. A cold 
potluck will be served. Hosts 
and hostesses will be Mr. and 
Mrs. Oscar Gustafson, Dick 
and Debbie Slakey and Mrs. 
Edna Banks. , h 

.. *. 
FRUITLAND GRANGE 

members will gather for an 
8 p.m. meeting Friday in the 
Fruitland Grange Hall accord­
ing ro Masrer Bob Geddes. 
Margaret Van Etten will show 
slides of the Scandinavian 
countries which she visisted 
countries which she visited 
last summer. Refreshments 
will be served by Albert and 
Lucille Odden, Lynn Williams 
and jack Gallagher. AllGran­
gers are welcome. h ... 

CAR WASH from 9 a.m. to 
4 p.m. next Wednesday at 
Les's Barber Shop, 617 S. 
112th, Parkland. Washing cars 
will be members of the Tami­
Ka-Pew Camp Fire, Horizon 
Club. Proceeds will be used 
for community service pro­
jects. Cars will be washed 
for 95¢. b 

onnet Show 

BUZZING WITH PLANS for their annual bonnet show 
to, iie he Id at 2 and 8 p.m. Tuesday, March 7, at the 
Lakewood Theater are members of the Ida S. Baillie 
Orthopedic Guild. Guild members Mesdames E.M. Maga­
rian, Kenneth Bowen, Stephen Farr, Robert L. Petherick 
and sewing chairman Mrs. Harold Liebe are working on 
miniature hat trees to be used to herald the arrival of 
the show. The public is invited and all proceeds will 
be 'for maintenance of the Mary Bridge Children's Hos­
pital. The theme this year is ".Alice in Bonnetland" 
and wi II preview spring hat fashions. Tickets may be 
purchased at the door or from Mesdames Chester Hill, 
Allen Smith, Barkus Adams, Sidney Long and ,Earl Da· 
vidson. 

TAI COBSOLIDATION AND 
PURCHASE LOANS ce 

1'0 _$3500 OR MORE 
WHEN FOLKS NIED MONEY 

ON 'HOME - FURNITURE • CAR - BOAT 

CASCADE INDUSTRl.AL LOAN CO.•· 
751 Commerce Ta-coma FU 3·2533 
F,.ee Parking A\ H4>tor ·Ramp Garage 

ROY RO~EO HAU. 

Sat.,· feb~ 18 
MUSIC: BY THE 

Country Boys 
Admission $1.25 

,, 



Spring Plans 

ANNOUNCING THE ENGAGEMENT of their daughter 
Mary Elizabeth Holcomb are Mr. and Mrs. Wallace L. 
Stricklin, Sr. of Tacoma to Gale Brian Nickel, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Berrie of Puyallup. The bride-elect 
is a librarian at Meeker and Spinning Schools in Puyallup 
follov.i ng her graduation from Central Washington State 
Co 1 lege in Bel Ii ngham. The future bridegroom was gra­
duated from Puyallup High School and Washington State 
University and is an engineer with the Boeing Aerospace 
Center in Kent. The couple plan a March 18 wedding in 

the Puyallup First Methodist Church.--Bell Studio 

PTA N~ws ·-----__:_____~ 

Franklin Pierce PTA 
To Discuss Smoking 

School personnel reponsi­
bilities, the parent's role and 
other aspects of the student 
smoking problem will be ex­
plored by the Franklin Pierce 
Jr.-sr. High PTA at 8 p.m. 
Monday in room 107 . of the 
High School. b 

All parents are welcome 
and those of 5th and 6th grad­
ers" are especia!l y encouraged 
to attend. 

Students from Ford Jr. High 
will demonstrate some of the 
curriculum materials used to 
help them learn of the dangers 
of smoking. Dr, J.H. .Billing­
sley will show the film,'' WHO, 
ME 711 and discuss the medical 
aspects of smoking. 

• * • 

Should your 
oil heat 
dealer 

feel smug? 

You would too! When you 
sell a product as good as 
oil heat at such a low price 
... it's hard to keep a 
straight face. 

1ii 
HEATS BEST 

OIL HEAT INSTITUTE OF WASHINGTON 

ANDREW CHRISTENSEN 
PTA invites former members 
to at1Dnd the Founder's Day 
program planned for the meet­
ing at 8 p.m. today (Wednes­
day) when the Golden Acorn 
awards will be presented. b 

Miss Turner will show a 
film of her trip to Europe, 
where she traveled 16 coun­
tries and lived in some of the 
homes. 

The annual skating party for 
students and families will be 
held February 21 from 7 to 
9:30 p.m. at the Tacoma Roll­
er Bowl. 

• * * 
BETHEL DISTRICT PRE­

SCHOOL PTA will meet at 8 
p.m. Tirnrsday in the Bethel 
Junior High home ec room. 
Please use the frontentrance. 
Magazines and bundled papers 
are still being sought for the 
paper drive. TI1ose with these 
items should call Mrs. Corbin, 
843 - 2470, or Mrs, Shirley 
Hartsell, LE 7-67 40. Guest 
speaker for the evening will 
be Bethel School psychologist 
David Sanford who will speak 
on "Learned Intelligence". 
Sanford's appearance was ori­
ginally scheduled for last 
month, but was postponed. b 

* * * 
WALLER ROAD PTA will 

celebrate Founder's Day when 
it meets Tuesday in the multi­
purpose room. A special skit 
and talent program will high­
. light the evening. Mrs. Elmer 
Molund' s Camp Fire girls will 
present the flag. Social hos­
tesses areMesdamesBobMy­
ron, Quentin Henderson, Roy 
Looker and Jerry Ainsworth. b 

* 
Members are seeking cloth-

ing, stuffed animals and jig 
saw puzzles for dependent 
children at Remann Hall. Any­
one who would like to donate 
these items is asked to call 
Mrs. Walter Elmat, WA 2-
5017, or Mrs. Guff McCray, 
LE 1-2256. 
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The following building per­
mits were issued last week 
by Connty Engineer Keitll F. 
Jones. 

B.F. Sterling, $3,000 office, 
5209-112th St. E. 

SALE 
STARTS WED. 

FEB. 15 

I 

GIRL'S 

SURFER 
SHIRTS 

·Pierce County Bldg .. Permits 
Charles E. LeTourneau, 

$17,000 duplex, 11301-11303-
96th Ave. e. 

Henry Bassi, $15,000 res., 

SHOP 
10302-58th Ave. Crt. E. 

M&P Development, $14,000 
duplexes, 3317 - 3315, 3319 -

T 

9 Only CASH & CARRY 9 Only 
FAMOUS NAME 

UMBRELLA TENT 11 c I *ALUM. POLES s360~. AssT'o. · *9x9 SIZE 
COLORS 
REG. 1.39 . *REG. $119.00 

Shredded Foam 

Page 5 

3321, 3323-3325 and 3327-
3329 S. 92nd St. 

Signal Oil Co., $12,000 ser­
vice station, 6420 N, Meri­
dian. 

QUANTITIES 
LIMITED 

HURRY 

45 RP 
Records 

LATEST HITS 

26~EA. 
CHILDREN'S 

Fur Parkas Bed Pillows 

S499 
EA. 

t 
Ea. While they last! 

10 INCH 

Crystal Glass Plastic S1ecials 
RUBBER 

II qt. Pail ... e e .29~ 
... 29~ 

Vase 23~ 
LARGE SIZE 

Head Scarf Ironing Pad Wastebasket. 
' cover 47~ Silver Tray. 

e e • .'29~ ~ 
,29Ja ,. While They Lastl 

• • • ,. I FITTED 
POTTERY 9 

COFFEE Dash Pan .... 

Reg. 

39t 

. ~ r;;::3ilt ~,;;::::::31 

UGS LOOK! 

22e E•. 

PLASTIC 

GLASSES 
10 oz . 

Sporting Goods Dept. 

39e $SHEETS 

DOZEN 1. 27 Ea. 

SweatshirtsR~~~~~5 $3.00 
Sweatshirts~~~~~~~ $2. 22 
Red Sweatshirts 96~A. 

;n LADIES 
I CAPRIS 

SIZES 10-18 

s 1.22 :PR. 

CERAMIC TONEX 14 TRANSISTOR TOSS 
Ash Trays Tape Recorder PORTABLE PILLOWS 

REG. 62A RADIO REG., 22 
994 'ts EA. *4 Transistor Compl. with batteries, 2.98 9 EA • 

METAL "'Batteries guu earp~ones, $799 . . WHITE ONLY 
Waste Basket included Ea. carrying case Bobby Sox 

2199~ *Reg. 14.95 REG. 12.95 , Ea. 
4 

PR. 5 7 ~ 
OPEN SHOP MART WEEKDAYS 

SUNDAYS DEPARTMENT STORE 10 A!M. - 9 A.M. 

11 A.M. - s P.M. 133rd & Pacific ,lve. 10 "·"'~~!·,·'*'· 



Tomhoffl s Furniture w i 11 
ho.Id >a grand reopening cele­
br'.'itlo.n Feb. 15 in their new 
$65;()00 building at 12716 Pa­
cific Avenue, · owner . Chris 
Thompson .announced last 
.vie ck. 

The celebration and sale 
willcontlnue tlirough Satur.­
day{Feb. 18, he ,stated. 

,The new structure replac".'s 
,the, one destroyed during a four 
houp fire June 3(). . Although• 
Tqtphoffl s have been doing 
bu:;;~ness from. the l}ew stoi;e 
s, in\! e la~~ November, the, 
.gr'and opening was dela.ycd un..; 
til shipments of opening stock 
had ]Jeen completed. 

Featuring such famous fUr­
ni,rgre lines as Slyter, Fashion 
Craft, Yorktown, Madera, Le,. 
~mettl, . Nan.tucker, Englander, 
Flin,1:-idge, and many more, 
the. store will carry an $80, 000 
inventory ,of.• furniture, appli,.. 
1m"es, and TV, Thompson 
stated. Customers will find 
~CAt Curtis Mathis, and Em­
er~on television on display, 
aionvell as Norge and.Maytag 
aPJ1liances. Carpet lines will 
include McGee, Downs, Mon­
arch, Robbins, and. )3eacon. 

pn hand to greet cu~tom­
ers will be sales manager Ted 

Barker, op8rati0ns ma_nager 
Ma--shall Gilberg, salesmen 
Jim Corp· and Charles Lar,.. 
kins. Betty Stutheit will man­
age the. office, 

TI1e 13,700 sq. ft. Parkland 
facility rejoins Tom ho ff 
stores in Puyallup and Lacey. 

NEXT WEEK1S HERALD 
WILL BE PUBLISHED 
ONE DAY· EARLY DUE 

JO WASHINGTON'S BIRTHDAY 
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OWNER CHRIS THOMPSON points out the features o 
the 295 sq. inch RCA Color TV he will offer during 
Tomhoff's Grand reopening sale to office manager Betty 
Stutheit. The sale will be held Feb. 15, 16, 17, and 18 
at the new 13,700 sq. ft. Pacific Ave. store at 12716 
Paci fie Avenue. 

Census Study Planned Here 
A selected sample of house­

holds in this area will be ask­
ed questions about employ­
ment during 1966 as part of 
the February Current Popula­
tion Survey conducted by the 
Bureau of the Census, accord­
ing to the Bureau's regional 
office in Seattle. b 

The 1966 employment sur­
vey will supplement questions 
qn employment and unemploy­
ment. asked each monty by 
Bureau enumerators for the 
U.S. Department of Labor's 
Bureau of Labor Statistics. 

The annual survey questions 
will be aimed at finding out 
the number of weeks worked 
dCiring the. year, the amount of 
time 1 o s t because of unem,.. 
ployment and ocher reasons, 
and the principal job held dur­
ing me year by each person 
in sample households. 

All. information given to 
Census interviewers will be 
kept confidential and may be 
used only for statistical pur­
po3es, Director Tharaldson 
said. 

Census inrerviewers who 

INCOME TAX 
All .KINDS. 

)'ear aro.und office 
established 1948 
BR 1.-1767 
755 Tacoma Ave. South' 
Open dally. if a.m. •·. 7 p,m; 
Sat. ti I 4: 30 p.m. 

will interview householders in 
this area are: Mrs. Doromy 
A. Carden, 1912 East 91st 
Street, Tacoma, and Mrs. Eth­
el M. Hindery, 3123 N. 31st, 
Tacoma. 

Should your 
oil heat 
dealer 

f~el smug? 

Naturally. Delivering the 
money-saving luxury heat· 
is something to be proud 
about. 

Oil HEAT INSTITUTE OF WASHINGTON 

r._· 4 :If 'ers Give . Pony Rides. =i 
Children in the Lister ing rides with over. 150 first 

School on E, 44th St. were grade children. 
treared to pony rides recent.,. Those free from school mat 
ly as part of a community ~y ~o help the children were 
service performed by the Tiny V1c_ki Hancock, Ray Cimino, 
Hoof 4-H Club. Juhe Revard, Barbara Wood, 

The 4-H'ers unloaded their Tom Wood, Rachel Haaland, 
horses on the school grounds Karen Stern, Jean Cimino and 
and spent me afternoon shar- - Barbara, Beth and john Bra­

tlie. 

CONGRATULATIONS 
TO 

TO OFFS 
FROM 

PARKLANDS FRIENDLIEST 

OTEL 
BLUE SPRUCE 

LE 7-3955 

FROM YOUR NEIGHBOR 
ACROSS THE STIHIE1' 

"BLUE SPRUCE SERVICE 
MINUTE MAN 

SERVICE 

PICK·UP & DEL.IVERY OPEN 7 A.M.-9 P.M. 

LE 7-9996 

CONGRATULATIONS 

FFS'' 
PARKLAND. 

CENTER 

11205 Pacific Avau 
MEMBER. FEDERAL OEP0$1T INSURANCE CORPOllATIOl'4 

MAY WE EXTEND OUR 
BEST WISHES TO 

TO OFFS 
ON THEIR NEW STORE 

DRYER MORTUARY 
220-l34th S.. LE 7-0253 

WELCOME 

TOM.HOFF$ 
"WE'll BE BACK 

IN MARCH" 

IS-REY INC 
[f 1-3230 
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IN C_ELEBRATION OF OUR NEW PARKLAND/STORE WE'RE 'OFFERING THESE 
MONEY SAVING SPECIALS ••• STARTING TODAY, 1WEDNESDAY,1 FEB. 15 

BEAU1UUl 5 PC. All HARDWOOD 

DINING ROOM SET 

3 only Traditional Gold Matelasse 

3 only Traditional orange rnatelasse 

REG. 309.95 

SAVE $110 

NOW. 

2 only 3 piece 

Tycora Ny Ion, one green, one go Id 

Colonial, Mediterranean, Contemporary, Traditional 

••• cocktail, lamp, magazine, end, record 

i°OVf S"f ATS •. ,. ,. .... 19 9. 9 5 f A'BIE"f ,,~ 20o/010FF 
I only CJ.Jilt colonial 

DAVENPORT ~~::~;entire stock 

& CHAIR Reg.399,95299.95 LAMPS 20o/o OFF 

Our largest 

; ••• in royal naugahyde in 7 di ff. colors 
BOX SPRING & Eng~::~~JK~~:SSize i 

RECLINERS R•g.149.9599.95IMATTRESS ,.,148.88 ~ 
BOf"SP.RINlf'"&'" [ 4 only 4 piece All nylon 

SECTIONALS ~:~:9s2J9.95IMAJTRESS sET98.88 ~ 

T 

GRAND OPENING SAU PRICES ON RCA COLOR TV AND STEREOS, MAYTAG 
WASHERS, DRYERS, NORG~ RHRIGERATORS, RANGES & WASHERS AND DRYERS 

Hundreds Of Othe·r Colonial & Contemporary Sale Items 
TERMS, NO DOWN PAYMENT ••• UP TO I 

36 MONTHS TO PAY ON WITH APPROVED CREDIT 

FF'S FURNIT 

SALE STARTS TODAY ••• FREE 
COFFEE & REFRESHMENTS 

E THE APLE S p 
128th & PACIFIC AVE. TACOMA LE 1-1878 1109 NO. MERIDIAN IPUYAllUP TH 5-1865 

SALE EFFECTIVE SALE EFf ECTIVE 
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BA(:HELOR apartment •. All 
utilities paid. $55. 7 ll-2nd 
Ave. NW, Puyallup. TH 5-
5792. 

- - - - -- - --- - - - - i 

BEDROOM unfurnished 
hhuse. 825 •Spinning Street, ' 
Sumner. Will be there Satur• i 
day. 1Q-4. , $85 plus deposit.· 
Packwood. 494-5.875. - ,- -- -- - -- - --- -

FURNISHJ:!)D upper and lower 
one bedroom apartments. 
Most utilities, included. $45 & 
$35. Sumner, UN 3-6101. 

-- -- - -- -- -- - -- ------
SMALL ... FURNISHED ground 
floor ... apt. E •. Main. Water, 
gar;bage, lights paid. $6P; 
Working couple or elderly 
lady. TH 5-8202. 

---------
SUMNER: Completely fur-
nished. 1 bedroom ground 
floor apt. Adults. Garage. UN 
3-7979; - -- - -- .... , - -- - -----

NEW, Nea~ Edgewood Square. 
Unfurni<>hed, One child. No 
pets. $110. WA 7-9796. 

-,- ~--:~,<- ~ ~--:-.----, 
KENT: Unfllrnishe,d 2 bdrms., 

Carpeting, drapes'. . applianc­
es, private patio. $140. TA 5-
4619. A7 1-2-3 

THE NEW 

CASCADIAN APTS.1 
Now completing 9 units with 
Patios, & carports. Dishwa'."' 
sher, tange and refrig •. 2 
bedrooms ·with large ward,;. 
robes, carpets, drapes . & 
storage. No children over 1-
year-old. Located 5 blocks 
from town or Citizens State ' 
Bank. 319-5th.St. s.E. 

S 125 with water, sewer 

TH 5-6464 

--------·· 
OLD AGE forces sale 1 acre, 

2 bedroom house. Electric 
and gas heat. Chicken house, 
small .barn, big garden space, 
5 fruit trees, berries, pas­
ture for cow •. 2 1/4 miles 
north of Sumner. $8,500. 
Reasonable down· payment. 
Owner • carry contract. No 
agents. Rt •. 1 Box 382, Sum,.. 
ner; UN 3-7331. 

~ - - --- - - -- - -- -- -
QNE acre, 4 blocks from 
Puyallup city center. Zoned 
for multiple units. $18,500 
cash or contract. TH5-1280. - ----- - -- -- -- -- - - ;.. -

----.--
BY bWNER: 4 bdrm. borne 

with double plumbing. rec­
reation room, buiH~in oven . & 
rarige. Garage,. A11 on one lev~ 
el. Landscaped. Garden storage 
shed. Large lot, TE 3-6581. 

A7 1-2-3 
WILL LEASE with ~ption t~ 

buy, 2 bedroom. Redondo 
Beach. WA 7.-4896. AZ 1-2-3 

700RiMPROVE:I5-Co'rs-;;:;-
residential area. · 2816 H St. 

S.E., Auburn. A9 1,2-3 
WATERFRO~T. Angle Lake, 

Snohomi.h. 60' frontage. lJ 
acres. Reduced to $4450. TF:. 3-
0854, AB 1-2-3 
ATTRACTIVE 3 bdrm.- 'home 

on level landscaped lot in 
20 ACRES - Thrift area. By Sumner. Paved street, close to 
owner. Trade or terms. On school, shopping. EZ FHA 
black top road, good condi- __ terms to qualified buyer. Call 
lion. $15,000 Vl 7-2473 or ' Bill. Williams, TE 3-.9198 or 
TH 5_7449 Equity Realty, TE 3-1234. 

• A7 1-2-3 
~ -- - -- --- ;... - - ----- OLDER 3 bdrm. h;;~;~;;;-AJ:" 
BUILDERS: View lot.on Kar- gona, large corner lot. 5 
shner Road, Nord1 Hill, Puy...; additional vacant lots available. 
allup. Lots of trees and Pan- FHA 1crrns or good contract. 
orarnic view of the valley. · Call Bi~I Williams, TE 3-9198 
Approximately 145'x175'. TH' or Equity Realty, TE A~· ll~~~j 
5-5272· - ' - ' -·-----.-· "' --

• BUILDING LOTS and develop-
-. - -.-·- -.- -.----- ment:acreage. Call Bill Wil-
5 ACRES - 3 bedroom house. Iiams, TE . 3-9.198 or Equity 
Graham area. By owner. Realty; TE 3-123.4. A7 1-2-3 
Fireplace, good view~ VI 7- -i_-H A --;:;;:a~q.;;;;d -ho,;;~- W; 
2473; TH 5-7449. , have a. few completely re-

- .;. -__ .;, __ _ _ _ ___ -I conditioned homes -in Federal 

2 BEDROOM home in Puyal• 
lup Gardens on· l acre of good . 
family soil. By owner, l915-
4th Ave. NW. 

5 ACRES - 2 bedroom house. 
Rhodes Lake. area. UN 3-
6666, 

2 ' 1/2 ACRES - 3 bedroom' 
home on 'East l.12d1. Very 
nice. Either GI or FHA aP­
praisal. Benedict Business 
Sales. WA 7"-2526. 

Way _area which are ·available 
on EZ terms. All 3 bdrm. Some 
with daylight basements. Call 
Mr. Hunt, AT 3-7186 or Equity 
Realty, :fE 3-1234. A7 1-2-3 
ONLY $12-;-s{)o_ ·Nothing down. 

approximately $400 closing, 
2 bdrm. older home, full base· 
rnent. Walking distance to 
shopping. Call Stella Lee, TE 
3-2740 or Equity Realty, TE 3-
1234. A7 1-2-3 

-N.C'AD80RN-:-Bea~tif~J-4~br, 
4 year old home, carpeting, 

drapes, built-ins, full basement. 
finished rec. room, Walk to 
schools and shopping. Ca 11 

- - - - - - --- - - - - Marti, TE 3-9749 or Equity 
PUYALLUP -. nice clean 2 R.ealty~ TE 3-1234. A7. 1-2-3 
bedr9om rambler, commo- -AVAILABLE -Nowf":·-N-.E.:---3-:­
dious living area with fire- bdrm. in excellent ar,ea. 3 

1 · plilce, utility and Rec. room, large bedrooms, 2} baths, f_irc-.. Real Estate For Sale HW fl 100 f 1 u - p I a c e, barbecue, carpct111g. 

TWO story 4-!Jedroom nome. 
I,.arge living room, dining 
rool11, lit •kitchen. GoodJoca­
tion, ¢lose to schools, 5 
block:;; . to downtown. Fenced 1 
back yard. $8500. 351-Sth i' 
St. S.E, 

---------
rooms, vi.ew of. valley and 
mountain, 1 1/2 baths,.day­
}ight basement, 2 fireplaces. 
Ovmel" ···will carry contract. 
UN &.60Q5 f!fter 5 p.m. 

Designers and Builders 
EXPERT WORKMANSHIP 

REASONABLE PRICES 
Easy Monthly Payments 

VAUGHAN'S 
84th & Pac. 4ve. GR 4-9515 

oors, . . t. ot. n drapes. Over 2 00 sq. ft. dou-
usual value at $13,500. Con- blc garage. Call Marti, TE. 3-
ventional. R.E.X. GR4-0503. 9749 or Equity Realty. TF. 3-
Call Frank Cooper TH 5- _12~4. A7 l-2·~-
8154. 40 ACRES hidden on riv e r 

I
- - _______ - _ _ _____ _ _ front 3 1niles to Boeings in 

· · Auburn. Will make a fine mo-
3 BDRMS., house in nice area; bile home city. TE 3-61 70, 

do,uble garage . and lovely AB 1.z,3 
yard 6:mo · lease $ 150 mo No -·--· · · .. · .. ----. ---
pets: Call .Helen' S~eele. · TE 3- 5 BE.AUTIF~L acres, I " v ." I, 

I 2678 or Equity· Realty, TE 3- . cleared, view of mountmns. 
123..4. A7 1-2-3 Less than $2,000. per acre, 
- -_ - "" - ~crn1s. Call evenings, 1-lelen 

. EXECUTIVE typ.." home, N.Ei Steele, TE. 3-21\ 78 .or Equity 
3 bdrm., .fanuly room, .22 Realty, TE. 3-12H. A7 i-2-l 

baths, carpeting,. drapes, built- - ---------- ·· "- - · ·-
ins. Call Marti, TE. 3-1234. TRADE your present home 
Equity Realty or TE 3-9749. equity or contract for new 

_ $2 50. A 7 __!:_~_-2_ one of your choice. 'Apex 

TophH 

111.MEl&SON 
·-···Excavating•-..: 

Bulldozing· loader. land 
Clearing· .Dump Trucks, 

Blasting - ~Road Construction 
Toi> Soil, Backhoe For Hire 

FREE ESTIMATES ·' 
'· LJi: .. 7,3165 VI 7•.71>; 

Realty, TH. 5-7505. 

LARGE wooded lot. 200x2001. 
Upper Jovita Blvd. UN 3-
1880. 

NEW 3 bedroom rambler. Bad1 
& 1/2, fireplace, double gar­
age. 2010 8th Ave. SE. TH 5-
1453. - -- - - - - - - -----

·SUNNY! Bright! View windows 
wid1 a view! S bedrooms, 3 
baths. Open· beams through• 
out! 4 years old. Birds! 
Woods! Deer! MaplesfSalall 
$35,000. TH 5-2073. 

To late 
To. Classify 

Movl11111.6 St~ 
J Fairnace• 

~oush Moving & -S)orage~ 
Agents for u.s. Van lines 

Coast to Coast Servic,e 

121 WEST STEWART' 

lit 5-5436/ 
.\ 
.I 

Sheet eta I 
• FumaeeRepair 

and Service 
Installations 11: •• 

I 

PARK LA 
FUEL Oil 

12002 Paeific: Ave. 
LiE 1-0256 .. 

NEED babysitter for large 
family. Swing shift, Live•in 
or own transportation. TH 5-
7068. 

- - - - - - - - -----
ESTATE to be settled - $12,-

000. Summit View area. By 
owner, Two bedrooms, large 
kitchen a1i'd dining roOm. 
Basement and attached ga­
rage. Newly redecorated. l 
3/4 acres M/ or L in fir 
trees and pasture. Call TH 
S..8096 for details. 

-------------
USED FRIGIDAIRE range. TH 

5-2081. 

FT, MONMOUTH, N,J, -
Private Curtis L, Parsons, 
20, son of Mr. and Mrs. Har­
ley E, Parsons, Route l, Box 

· 3300, Spanaway, completed an 
audio - visual technician 
course at die Army Signal 
School, Ft. Monmouth, N,J,, 
Feb. 3. 

* * * 
VIETNAM - Army Special­

ist Fourth Class \,Vesley G0 

Ostrem, 2'5, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Thorvald C, Ostrem, 302 
E, 84th, has arrived .in Viet­
nam with his unit, the 9th In .. 
fantry Division. 

* * * 
VIETNAM - Private First 

Class. Don M. Rockwell, 21, 
son of Mr, and Mrs. Merrill 
D, Rockwell, 14301 25th .Ave., 
Court E, has arrived in Viet­
nam wi.d1 his unit, the 9d1 In­
fantry Division. 

* * * 
VIETNAM -ArmyStaffSer-

geant Ernest L, Behm, 28, 
whose wife, Gisela, lives at 
4806-lOSth, is participating in 
"Operation Sam Houston" in 
Vietnam with the 4th Infantry 
Division. 

* * * 
VIETNAM -Army Staff Ser­

geant Samuel B, Snyder, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Samuel F. Snyd­
er, Route 1, Box 523, Graham, 
participated in a proficiency 
parachute jump near Kontum, 
Vietnam, January 17-19. b 

* * * 
VIETNAM - EdwardV.Sch­

erer, 29, .whose wife, Thea­
dora, lives at 16821 C St., 
Spanaway, was promoted to 
Army captain Jan. 11 in Viet­
nam, where he is a member of 
the 4th Infantry Division. 

* *"* 
VIETNAM - Army Private 

.First Class Jerry D. Millage, 
!9, son of Mr. and Mrs. Harry 
Millage, 903 S. l 42nd, was as­
signed as a door gunnar Jan. 17 
in Company A, 228th Aviation 
Battalion, 1st Cavalry Divi­
sion (Airmobile) in Viemam. 

* * * 
VIETNAM - Army Major 

Darrell D. jurling, son of Mrs. 
Virgini<\ McDill, whose wife, 
Donna, lives on Route 1, Box 
1751, Spanaway, received the 
second award of the Air Medal 

New Waller Road 
4-H Club Elects 
Terri Larsen 

WALLER ROAD - Terri 
Larsen was named president 
of a newly organized 4-H cook­
ing. and ·sewing group in the 
Waller Road area. b 

Other officers assisting her 
are vice president Mkhelle 
Bowne, secretary Nancy Ja­
cobson and treasurer Cheri 
Taylor. 

The girls met last week in 
the J.C. Taylor home, 9019 E. 
Vickery, to make Valentines 
for Remann Hall youngsters. 

Other members of.the grade 
school age group are Paula 
Agnew, Cheryl Corrigan, Kri­
sti Simpson, Leslie Stephens 
and Debra Sanford. 

Charm School 
Set For Dairy 
Princesses 

A charm ·school for Dairy 
Princess candidates from 
Pierce, King, and Kitsap coun­
ties will be conducted Satur­
day, Feb. 25, in Room 741, 
County - City Building, Ta­
coma. b 

Franc Fraley, a profession­
al model and charm consul­
tant, will conduct the se'ssion. 

in Pleiku, Viemam, Jan. 21. 
Maj. Jurling earned the a­

ward for combat aerial sup-­
port of ground operations in 
Vietnam. 

* * * 
USS BENNINGTON - Fire­

man Apprentice William D. 
Bard10lomew, USN, sonofMr. 
and Mrs. F.U. Bartholomew 
of Route I, Eatonville, has 
completed a 45-day patrol off 
the .coast of Vietnam, as a 
crewmeqilier aboard the anti­
submarine aircraft carrier 
USS Bennington. 

After a five day rest and 
recreation period in the Bri­
tish Crown Colony of Hong 
Kong, she will rejoin the sev­
Kong, she will re j o in the 
Seventh Fleet. in the Gulf of 
Tonkin. 

* * * 

Everest Gear 
To Be Given 
To PLU Thurs. 

'I11e special equipment used 
by a Pacific Lutheran Univer­
sity alumnus when he stood on 
the top of Mount Rainier will 
he presented to the school dur­
ing a student convocation 
Thursday, Feb. 16. 

john Mccallum, author of 
11 Everest Diary," will make 
the presentation during a 9:50 
a.m. convocation in Eastvold 
Chapel. 'I11e public is invited. 

The equipment was worn by 
Luther (Luke) Jerstad when 
he and four American com­
panions stood on top of the peak 
in 1963. 

Mccallum wrote his book 
11 Ev ere st Diary" on the ac­
complishments of Jerstad and 
his party. The book is based 
on a dairy carried by jerstad. 

He plans to give PLU' s 
Mortvedt Library the original 
manuscript of the book. 

Jerstad is presently a 
speech instructor at the Uni­
versity of Oregon. While a 
student at PLU he was a mem­
ber of the basketball teams 
tl1at went to three national 
tournaments. 

Following his climb, PLU 
presented him with the first 
Distinguished Alumni Award 
during special ceremonies at 
Alumni Day in 1964. 

It was just one of many 
awards to be given Jerstad. 
Earlier President John F. 
Kennedy presented him with 
die Hubbard Award Medal, die 
National Geographic Society's 
highest honor. 

He started climbing when he 
was 15 years old and a high 
school stude.nt in Gig Harbor. 
He has climbed Mt.McKinley, 
the highest mountain in North 
America, and otl1cr peaks in 
Alaska, the Yukon, the Pacific 
Northwest and Colorado. 

Area Students 
On UW Honor Roll 

Several area students were 
among more than 1,500 Uni­
versity of Washington stu­
dents who qualified for the 
undergraduate Honor Roll for 
Autumn Quarter the Univer­
sity announced today. b 

To be eligible for the Hon­
or Roll, a student must have 
a grade point average of at 
least 3.5. 

Included were Franklin L,, 
Dacca (Fife), Julia K. Mar­
shall (Sumner) and Glen R. 
Bowser, Dale Hammermeis­
ter, Tim Innes, Linda Matt­
son, Don G. Reichert a n d 
Joan M. Teachrnan(allofPuy.;. 
allup). 

Others were Sharron L. 
Shannon (Spanaway)andMary­
wave Vanderen .(Eatonville). 

FP Winter 
Concert 
Thursday 

The annual Franklin Pierce 
winter concert will be held 
Feb. 16 at 8 p.m. in the high 
school gym sponsored by the 
music department and com­
plimentary to the public. 

TI1e groups performing will 
be the concert band, varsity 
band, the orchestra and the 
large. choir. 

The concert band will play 
"Sea Songs, 11 "Lula Flores," 
and "Slaughter on Tenth Ave­
nue." 

A piano solo with the band 
will be done by Paul Schiller. 

"Three Classic Dances," 
and ''Highlights From the King 
and l' 1 will be done by the var­
sity band. 

The orchestra will play 
''UivaldiViolin ConcertoSch­
erzo" and "Sumer is icumen 
in." 

11 Prelude and Fugue in G 
Minor" and "Overture for 
Winds" will be done by the 
combined concert and varsity 
bands. 

A number of songs will also 
be sung by the large choir. 

Legal Notices 
GEORGE F. POTTER 

ATTORNEY AT LAW 
159 South I J 2th Street 

Parkland, Washington 

SUPERIOR COURT OF WASHINGTON FOR 
THE COUNTY OF PIERCE 

Estate of MAUDE E, 1VEIT Deceased. 
Probate No, 757 !5 

NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
The undersigned has been appointed and 

has qualified as Executrix of the estate of 
Maude E. Tveit, deceased. Each person 
having a claim against the above named 
i;erson 01· his estate musr serve the claim, 
duly verified by the claimant, on the under­
signed OC' his attorney{s) of record at the 
address stated below and must file it 
with the clerk of the court, together with · 
proof o_L the service. within six :momhs 
after the date of first publication of this 
notice or the claim will be barred • 

Dare of first publication February 15, 
1967. 
Olive !wanna Bartoy 
Executrix of said Estate 
Address !59 South 112th Street, 
Tacoma, Washington 98444 
George F. Potter 
Attorney(s) for the Estare 
Address !59 South !12th Street 
Parkland 
(Telephone): LEnox 1·2889 

Published February 15, 21 and March I, 
1967. 

GEORGE F. POTTER 
Attorney at Law 
159 SOUTH I 12TH 

PARKLAND, WASHINGTON 

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT 
OF THE STATE OF WASH­
INGTON IN AND FOR PIERCE 
COUNTY 
CURTIS W. HALL Plaintiff 
vs. JULIA E0 HALL Defen­
dant 

No. 168699 

SUMMONS BY PUBLICATION 
THE STATE OF WASHING­

TON, to the said JULIA E0 

HALL 
YOU ARE HEREBY SUM­

MONED to appear within sixty 
(60) days after the date of 
first publication of this sum­
mons, to-wit: Within sixty 
(60) days after the 1st day of 
February, 1967, and defend 
the above-entitled action in 
the above-entitled court, and 
answer the complaint amend~ 
ed of the above-named, and 
serve a copy of your Answer 
upon the undersigned Attorney 
for Plaintiff at his office be­
low stated; and in case of your 
failure to do so, judgment 
will be rendered against you 
according to the demandofthe 
complaint amended which has 
been filed with the Clerk of 
said Court, 

This is an action for div= 
orce. 
GEORGE F0 POITER 
Attorney for Plaintiff 
Office and Po:;t Office 
Address: fJ 
159 South 112th Stteet 
Parkland, Washington 98444 

Published February 1, 8,15, 
22, March 1 and 8, 1967, 
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HI HO PUYALLUP 

EL EASTE IN-FE 
WELL· TRIMMED 
CENTER CUT 

Pork Chops 

~~ .. ~TRY SPARERIBS ••••••••• 69~ 
K CHOPS DOUBLE THICK 79c 

. FOR STUFFING 0 0 0 0 0 lb . 

::~~AND PORK ROAST .......... 79~ 
WHOLE PORK LOINS CUT THE 7· 5 c OR HALF " " .wA! v~u !'5~ " lb 

~~::my PORK SAUSAGE e 0 0 0 0 39~ 
:::~::s COTTAGE ROLLS .•.•• 79~ 

HI HO 

HI HO EVAPOUTID ~~ STRAWBERRY OR (HOC. s~~~E SUNDAES 2/39t NO. F66 GENERAL ELECTRIC 

ILK $ $ $ 9 @ $ @& 8/1°0 
THOSE KRAZV COOKIES .· ......... 4 doz. 1°0 STEAM IRON 911 

2
'·0Z. SALT 10 c MORTON'S • 11 e . 1111 

IRONING CADDY 
10:~1:f:5• . FISH STICKS 

303 TINS SA LE . 303 TINS 

DUCHESS CANNED GOODS 

REG. 4.99 IEASY·ROUING 
C:AS'l'IERS • • • • • • 211 

pkg. 49' 
APPLESAUCE THE 

~ I DAIHGOlD CUBE BUTTER ... . •&.11' CUT BEANS 
CREAM CORN 
WHOLE K. CORN 
PEAS 

TS SHOP 

.. 
= = A. 

FOi THIE FINEST OF VALENTINE 

CANDY try CANDY LAND 

OPEN <iS ~i~~M~ 8 A.M. 

LOWEST DRUG PRICES FOUND ANYWHERE 

·RIG.. '1.49 'I OOs 

EXCEDRIN •• 97< 
REG. 69~ 

TOMATOES 
SPINACH 
PEAS and CARROTS 
FRUIT COCKTAIL· 

CE 

SKI EQUIPMENT ~~:CIALTY 

SKI PACKAGE NO. 'I 
SKIS, POLES, BINDINGS, TOE PIECES 

00 Value • a II Now 2845 

SKI PACKAGE NO. 2 
FOR THOSE WHO WANT THIE 
FINER SET. 

A 5200 VALUE ....... 3695 

SUNKIST NAVEL 9 C REG. 1295 FAIL PROOF 

RESOLVE••• 49c ORANGES lb 1/4" ·~::~·· DRILL ...... 995 

REG. 1.09 CAL. GREEN CABBAGE .... lb. 1oc 
VITAllS •••• 67( CHERRY TOMATOES ......... cup 19( 

FULL SIZE, RUBBER, AUTO 

FLOOR MATS • • • 139 

PRICES 

EFFECTIVE 

FEil. 13-1 ll'H 

HI HO 

IN~~ 
PUY A.Lil.UP · 

ONLY MINUTES AWAY 

OPEN 
8 AM._n P.M. 

EVERY DAY 

4-FT. WOOD 

STEP 
LADDERS 

47 

PUYALLUP _ 

z .... 
z 
0 
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Ervie H. Christilaw 
Services for Ervie H. 

Christilaw, 57, of Rt. 1, Box 
1520-6, Spanaway Monday af­
ternoon at Mountain View Gar­
den Chapel. 

Rev. Robert G. Hill stead of­
ficiated. Burial was in Moun­
tain View Memorial Park. 

Christilaw died last week 
in a hospital. He was born in 
Olalla and had lived in the 
Tacoma area all his life. 

NEW MAYFAIR MARKET at 966.0 Pacific Avenue is near­
ing completion according to manager John Keeler. The 

25,375 sq. ft. structure will soon replace Park'N Shop, 
adjaceant to the above property but not pictured. 

'Christilaw was a mechanic 
employed by Nalley' s. He had 
been a member of the Auto­
motive Mechanics Union, Lo­
cal 1152, for 25 years and was 
a member of Tacoma Trail 
Cruisers, the Centaurs of 
Washington and the Methodist 
Church. 

New ayfair To Open In arch Surviving are his wife, Er­
dine; two daughters, Mrs. Ca-r 
role Lindberg, of Aurora, 
Minn., and Mrs. Sandra Wild­
man, living in Okinawa; a bro­
ther, Harvey, of Seattle; and 
three sisters, Mrs. Sadie 
Cook, of Bell Gardens, Calif., 
Mrs. Sophia McCullough, of 
Spana way, and Mrs. Doris Ea­
ton, of Parkland. 

Mayfair Markets plan to 
open their new building at 
9660 Pacific Avenue in early 
March, store manager ] ohn 
Keeler disclosed last week. 

The old Park 1N Shop build­
ing will be torn down and re­
placed by a chain drug store 
after Mayfair moves into the 
new facilities, Keeler stated. 

The new structure will boast 
25,375 sq. feet of floor space 
including a bakerrcapable of 
producing 3000loaves of bread 
per shift. The bakery will 
supply oth[:r Mayfair Markets 
in the county, he said. 

Mayfair customers will find 
the new facilities greatly ex-

panded over the present store. 
11 We'11 have over 52 running 

feet of dairy and delicatessen 
display, over 68 feet of fresh 
meat display, and over 60 
feet of refrigerated produce, 11 

Keeler stated. 11 In addition, 
the new market will feature 
nearly 158 feet of frozen food 

Switch to 1967 
SPEED QUEEN Quality 
::: :x:: "1\ With the World's 1st 

~ 

$ 

PllCIS 

sr.11r Ar 

95 
W/T 

1 • 

GUARANTEE 
on Entire 

Transmission 

5-YEAR 
LABOR GUARANTEE ON TRANSMISSION 

2-Y 
GUARANTEE ON All DRYERS 

Tired of fighting the battle 
of washday 1 Then switch to 
Speed Queen quality. New 
Speed Queen washers and 
dryers feature lifetime 
stainless steel tubs and 
drums. And 111 new Durable 
Press eycle assures perfect 
results- every time -with 
these wonder fabrics, Slam 
the lid on expensive re· 
pairs~ Switch to Speed 
Queen quality-today! · 

e NO MONEY DOWN WITH TRADEI 
e LOW, LOW EASY PAYMENTSI 

space." Thirteen check stands 
will greet customers at the 
grand opening. 

The drug store will be built 
south of the new structure 
with the buildings joined by a 
common concourse. A restau­
rant will be on the market side 

MAYFAIR MARKET MANAGER John Keeler reviews plans 
for finishing new store at 9660 Pacific Avenue with builder 
Ted Varey. 

Donald C. Hicks 
Requiem Mass for Donald 

Charles Hicks, 44, of 9908 E. 
Polk St., Tacoma, was of­
fered Monday morning at St. 
John of the Woods Catholic 
Church with rosary recited 
the previous evening at the 
church. 

Burial was in Mt. View 
Memorial Park under the dir­
ection of Mt. View Funeral 
Home. 

Hicks died last week in a 
hospital after a three-week 
illness. She was born in Mis­
soula, Mont., and came to Ta­
coma in 1945. 

He was employed by the 
Criterion Millwork Co., Inc. 
and was an Army Veteran of 
World \Var II. 

Hicks was a member of 
St. John of the Woods Catho­
lic Church at Midland. 

Western Monumental: 
AND. Marble INC .. 
Reliable, Prompt Service 

in All Cemeteries 
1106 Center St. FU 3-5538: 

Marble for the Home 

Surviving are his wife, Lil­
liam R.; three sons, Charles 
M. and Donald M., both of the 
home, and john C., in Ger­
many; three daughters, Lil­
lian Kay, Catherine M. and 
Sue E., all of the home; a 
brother, Andy ]., of Escon­
dido, Calif,; and six sisters, 
Mrs. Josephine Davis, of Ta­
coma, Mrs. Edna Eckolm, of 
Ohio, and Mrs. Gay Farren, 
Mrs. Liddia McCauley, Mrs. 
Sylvia McVey and Mrs. Patri­
cia justice, all of Spanaway. 

Lillian McDermaid 
Services were heldrecently 

for Mrs. ] ohn McDermaid, 71, 
of 3611 E. !20th St., Tacoma, 
at Dryer Mortuary. 

Rev. Herbert Miller offi .. 
ciated. 

Mrs. McDermaid died at 
her home last week. She was 
born in Crested Butte, Colo., 
and came to this area 16 years 
ago from Kenilworth, Utah. 

Surviving are a daughter, 
Collette, of tl1e home; a son, 
john F., of Mountain View, 
Calif.; and a sister, Mrs. 
Nellie Gunther, of Pueblo, Co­
lo. 

GRAND OPENING 
FIB. 17 .. 18 

PENNY'S 

DONUTVllLE SANDWICH SHOP 
FRll 

COFFEE & DONUT BALLS 

2TO 5 P.M. 
l;lonut~ fo~ al I occasi.ons to go, 

9201 PACIFIC AVENUE (Pacific Center) 

GR 2-9868 

Robert L. Martin 

Services will be held at 
noon today in Mt. View Valley 
Chapel for Robert L. Martin, 
59, of 2004 s. 138th St., Park­
land. 

Rev. Harold Long officiated. 
Burial was in Mt. View Ceme­
tery. 

Martin died this week at the 
wheel of his automobile. He 
was logging and forestry man­
ager for St. Regis PaperCom­
panyt s Tacoma area opera­
tions. 

Born and educated at Tole­
do, Wash., he began his log­
ging career as a teen-ager, 
and he had worked in the wes­
tern forests from Canada to 
California. 

In the 19301s, he was acon­
tract logger for the old St. 
Paul and Tacoma Lumber Co. 
In 19 43, he became logging 
foreman and then logging SUP­

erintendent of the Ladd Log­
ging Co., a Tacoma based 
firm of timber owners and 
liquidators. 

When Ladd merged with St. 
Paul and Tacoma in 1952,Mr. 
Martin was named general 
logging superintendent. Short­
ly after the merger of St. 
Paul and. Tacoma with St. Re­
gis in 1958, he was named 
logging and forestry manager. 

Martin served on the board 
of directors of tl1e Industrial 
Forestry Association and the 
board of the Forest Indus­
tries Radio Communications. 
He founded Baseball Enter­
prises, Inc., a non-profit or­
ganization to develop and sti­
mulate tl1e interest of young 
folk in logging and forestry 
careers. 

He was a member of Seat­
tle's Rainier Club, a paster 
tle' s Rainie.r Club, a past mas­
ter of Tenino Lodge No. 86, 
F&AM; a past patron of Alice 
Chapter No. 32, OES, a mem­
ber of the York Rite andScot­
tish Rite bodies and a member 
of Afifi Temple of the Shrine,· 
and the Royal Order of ]est­
ers. 

He is survived by his wife, 
Blanche; a son, Norman L., 
a senior at the University of 
Puget Sound; a brother, Fred 
L., of Tenino; and three sis­
ters, Mrs. Dorothy Carlson, 
of Bucoda, Mrs. Zona Seals, 
of Roseburg, Ore., and Miss 
Lillian Martin, of San Fran­
cisco. His nephew, Roger A. 
Martin, is logging manager 
for St. Regis at Tacoma. 

Should-your 
oil heat 
dealer 

feel smug? 

Sure thing. Those low 
winter heating bills prove 
he's more than just a fair 

weather friend. 

-oat 
ff£ATI BEST 

Oil HEAT INSTITUTE OF WASHINGTON 



JOHN VANDEVANTER 

They don't FORECAST. the weather any more, 
Fahrenheit .•. they just HANDICAP it. 

"803 chance of rain" . • . your Aunt Fanny. 
You'd think we wanted to put $2 on a cloudburst 
or buy a combination ticket on a light drizzle. I 
don't want to be TOUTED on the weather, Fahren­
heit • • • I want information, even it it's wrong. 

Can't you remember as a kid •.• preparing a 
picnic in the glow of "high variable cloudiness 
and changeable light to moderate breezes?" Re­
member the excitement? Remember the beach and 
the bonfire? Remember the rain that washed the 
wienie right off your stick? THAT was living, Fah­
renheit. Who wants to plan a picnic in the face of 
"30% chance of rain"· when you're down to your 
20% underwear until washday? 

Sure, it's' an improvement •.. for the WEATHER­
MAN. He can't lose with a point spread like that. 
When it either rained or it didn't rain, he was wrong 
about half the time. Now, he can say "30% chance of 
rain" ... if it doesn't, he's 70% right and if it does, 
he's 1003 right. It figures out to an 853 batting 
average on the same kind of prophecy you can get 
with the Farmer's Almanac ..• ANY Farmer's 
Almanac. 

Not bitter, Fahrenheit. Just irritated. This morn­
ing, driving to work, I hear this meteorological 
magician talking out of the bottom of a rain -
barrel. While the radio goes "bleep ... bleep 
. . • bleep" to show this is being recorded and my 
windshield swipes go "smick .• smuck .•• smick 
. . . smuck", through the crown of his derby he 
tells me there is "80% chance of measurable pre­
cipitation today and 703 tonight." 

What do I EXPECT? Well, Fahrenheit, if that's 
a joke they should dub in some laughter. If it's the 
bookies' morning line, then I want the short odds or 
a 21-point spread on the long-shot. Why, I'd like 
to offer 8 to 5 we'll be going home by canoe tmtil 
mid-May. 

Whattayamean I don't know what · I'm talking 
abou ••• 

Now, look, Fahrenheit, you're getting •.. 
Wait a MINUTE, there. I'm not EITHER all .wet. 

Not more'n "90% chance this evening, increasing 
to •.• " 

GOOD SAMARITAN 
Mr. and Mrs. Leonard Be­

craft, 5908-87th Ave. E., girl, 
Feb, 1. 

Mr. and Mrs. William 
Crain, 12403-94th Ave. E. #20, 
girl, Feb. 2. 

Mr. and Mrs. Louis Taylor 
III, 310-9th St, N,E., boy, 
Feb. 2. 

Mr. and Mrs. OttoMoebius, 
Rt. l, Box 405, Graham, boy, 
Feb, 2, 

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Brink, 
P.O. Box 301, Eatonville, boy, 
Feb. 2. 

Mr. and Mrs. William Bak­
er, 1006-9th Ave. N. w., girl, 
Peb. 3, 

Mr. and Mrs. Donald Chris­
tensen, Rt. 3, Box 178, Sum­
ner, boy, Feb. 3. 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Little­
john, 8 ll-4tll St. S.E., girl, 
Feb. 4. 

Mr. and Mrs. Sidney Cov­
Ille, 314 E, Corrin St., Orting, 
boy, Feb, 5. 

Mr. and Mrs. John McKee, 
12617-97th Ave. E., boy, Feb. 
5. 

Mr. and Mrs. Douglas Will­
is, 3ll-2nd St, N0 E0 #2, girl, 
Feb. 6, 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Dow­
ney, 10706-136th St. E., boy, 
Feb. 6. 

Mr. and Mrs, Daniel Mey­
er, 723 Chestnut St., Sumner, 
girl, Feb. 6. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ronald Wol­
verton,, 608-62nd Ave. Ct. N. 
E., girl, Feb. 6. 

Mr, and Mrs. Norman Ken­
ney, Rt. 2, Box 2474, Span-
11way, girl, Feb. 7. 

TACOMA GENERAL 
Mr. and Mrs. Dick T. Osa­

ka, 24ll-15th Ave., Milton, 
boy, Feb. 3. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gus E0 Hay­
es, 13902 E. "811 , boy, Feb, 4. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lyman G. 
Tracy, 2204 E0 12lst St., boy, 
Feb, 7. 

Mr. and Mrs, Carl C. Bran­
stetter, Jr., 17804-70thSt. E., 
Bonney Lake, boy. 
Bonney Lake, boy, Feb, 9. 

LAKEWOOD GENERAL 
HOSPITAL 

Mr. and Mrs. Sherman Tor­
ly, 801 S. I34th, girl, Feb. 6. 

Mr, and Mrs. Eugene L. An­
derson, 1218 S. l02nd, girl, 
Feb. 8. 

ST. JOSEPH' s 
Mr. and Mrs. Donald G. 

Doyle, 2015 E0 120th, girl, 
Jan. 23. 

Mr. and Mrs, James R.. 
I Brand, Ft. l, Box 126, Roy, 
; girl, Jan. 25. 

Mr. and Mrs. Walter c. 
· Stegman, 2402 Berry Lane, 

Fife, boy, Jan. 25. 
Mr. and Mrs. Ronald K. 

Ogden, Rt. 2, Box 1855, girl, 
Jan. 29. 

Mr, and Mrs. Richard H. 
Baughn,, 421 S. 125th, girl, 
Feb. 2. 

Mr. and Mrs. Larry G. Ro­
binson,, 315 S. 125th, boy, Feb. 
6, 

HEADQUARTERS. 
"MOST FOR THE MONEY" 

All Makes ... All Kinds 
ARMS'IRONG'S 

USED CARS LE 7-5524 
11109 Pacific Ave. 
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30 • 1nu es, 

A 53 Mercury driven by Gordon Durkee, Tacoma, collided with a 64 Chev operated by 
Kathleen M. Clinger, Tacoma, about 4:50 p.m. Feb. 9 at 146th and Pacific. No injuries 

were reported. 

IMR-S~ENC·E·-:1:··BUSENllJs,6o;·i-a.coma, received a severe back injury and head 
cuts at 5:35 p.m. when the car she was driving was rear ended by a vehicle driven by 
Leo Arnestad of Spanaway. Mrs. Busenius was taken to Good Samaritan Hospital by 

. Parkland Ambulance. Arnestad was not injured. 

DAMAGED MERCHANDISE 
FURNITURE· GROCERIES 
SOME OF THIS WEEKS SPECIALS 

Reg. 89¢ 

WINDSHIELD 

DE ICER 

Table Size 

~ I 1 NST1 A0

Nel 
COFFEE 

OVER 1000 
ITEMS AT 1/ IOFF 

OPEN: Weekdays 10 AM-8 PM Saturdays 10 AM-6 PM 

SALVAGE MART 
13014 Pacific Ave. 

'"';·· 

\Wolfs,/ Wolf ls 
To Join Flock 
I 

Pastor Daryl C, Wildermuth 
opening a series of confirma• 
tion classes Thursday night 
learned the names of tl1e five 
attending were Bill Wolf, Mrs. 
Bill Wolf, Mrs. Bill Wolff, 
another Mrs, Bill Wolff and 
a Miss Wolff. b 

1 "l shouldn't have too diffi­
' cult a time remembering last 
names, 11 mused the pastor of 
Our Saviour Lutheran Church, 
4519 E. 112th. 
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G~rapplers Slated or 
Fri~ Saturday ctio 

13Y WAt,'f luPPE.'R. 

Hello, Arnie? 
"Hello, Operator? I'd like to place a person-to­

personcall to Arnie Palmer in Latrobe, Pennsyl­
vania ... yes, I'll wait/' 

"Da . da ·de dum de dum ... I lost my niblick, in 
sand trap city .•• down by the pond, of Linden's 
shores ••• when I return, to .•. hello Amie?" \ . • . be. . e r'"v, 

''Say, Amie .•• Just - 1ltL I..' 
tween you and me ••• can- ~1.-..:;,. -' 
(·el mytoumament com­
mitments . for about, oh, 
maybe five years or so. 
Now don't blow your stack 
. ... I know I told you l was 
another Ben Hogan, but that 
was last week, You don't 
net.'Cl •a trick shot artist, do 
you?> Man, I've got a: col -
kction of shots that throws 
the law of gravity right out 
the window." 

"What's th a. t, Amie? 
What clubs am I havin' 
trouble with? Well, let's 
se<: ••• my McCulloch chain 
chain saw is gettin' a little .. -- . ·. 
dull, just won't zip through '"~·~ ,, 
llic bigger coniferous any more. Then my trench 
shove~.· has a broken handle .. ··• I tried to nm a 
tunnel through.· an overhanging sand· trap so's I 
could putt out, My Handy-DandYcompacl !;1wnmow-
er doesn't do the job it used to in the rough. I tell 
,you, Arnie ••• it's a combination of lhing:.; .that has 
ru i.ned my game." 

"Take last Sahirday, for example. I'm slicing 
m;y woods and hooking my irons. I go up a fairway 
iike <mold fashioned sailing ship ;aching into the wind. 
l\1:y pedometer indicated I waH,cd 16 mile::; to play 
nin(' ho.lcs at Linden. No, I'm notcxaggcrating ••• 
I could play 18 \v ith a pool cue and a ping pong bal I 
and. tah:c Jess strokes ... I'm using my puUer in an 
op,..ah c.lass .•• ii draws the most wiggly lines you 
C\'e r :-;.aw." 

·•ui-.eouragcd? .. Not. really ... dhgu!->icd is lhe 
word .. Slmcks, r \\OU!dn't mind if mydri\c only 
sliced mer to tht> adjoining fairway, but what do yon 
do 1\·h011 it winds up behind yo11 aflc·1· boonwr:mging 
through a ~OfJ yard circle?" 

''What's my plans? Oh, 1111 l\C't'P practicing ... gel 
th<lr ol' intestinal fortitude back lo a hii;h peal\ ••• 
then when 1 gel my game bad\ iii lhl' 70':-;, I'll give 
you another cal I. l\Iaybc ymi t'<J.11 help. mt· with Uw 
back nine .. . Amie'? He! lo, ,\mfr? Ope l'Hror, I 
thinh 11 e've been cut off. What's that? l\!y pany hu11g 
up? Oh, well .•• reverse the charges ... rhc.v .should 
pay rne jw, t to hecp this kind of a game off the cit'­
cuit. U would set the game of golf bach a hundred 
yean .. " 

Cruisers In Tourney 
EA TONVl{...LE .,, ·The Crui­

ser basketball team took a 
long winning s.treak to Win­
lock last night, afready as­
sured of a berth in this week 
end's Central League Tourn­
ament at.Olympia, 

The Cruiser five, which 
scrambled up from the second 
division to fourth place in the 
Sl:ll.te' s ·toughest Class A Lea- ' 
gue, . will be facing the tough• 
ei>t. such competition in the 
state Saturday. Raymond and 
Elma, tie_d for the league lead 
and also virtually for the No. 
1 poll position in the state, 
both will see action there, 

Eatonville held . Charles 
Wright to a single point in J:b.e 
second quarter . to pile up a 
38-15 halftime lead Friday 
night. •'The Cruisers contin• 
ued to roll in the second half ' 
to a 68-39 victory. 

Hermsen and Bloo.m paced , 

the winners with 10 points 
each. There were 11 Cruis­
ers who tallied during the con­
test. 

Even a loss to .12th [Jlai;e 
Winlock last night could have 
left Eatonville no worse than 
in a fourth place tie. 

STANDINGS MONDAY 

Elma 
Raymond 
Yelm 
Eatonville 
Tenino 
St. Martin• s 
Ocosta 
Montesano 
Orting 
White Pass 
Wright 
Winlock 
Rochester 

r-:--· 

W L PF PA 
14 1 1094 805 
14 1 · 1041 705 
14 3 ll61 928 
l'l 5 1-22 848 
11 6 1112 989 
9 7 992 890 
8 8 852 927 
7 9 832 888 
7 10 995 1034 
4 13 880 1131 
2 13 655 896 
2 14 746 1018 
215 722 1046 

The West Central District 
wrestling tournament, with a 
trip to the State event the fol­
lowing week as the goal, opens 
Friday in Puyallup with the 
host Vikings, Auburn, North 
Thurston and Fife figurea as 
.the strongest hopes for tc:am 
honors. 

Individually the mammouth 
tourney has Puyallup leading 
with nine entries afteI" the 
Viks won their .third straight 
Puget Sound League tourney 
last Friday an~1.5aturday when 

~-B~s 
10pen Second 
Cage Round 

Second round games. were 
initiated th i s week in the 
Pierce County Senior Boys 
League. 111e slate opened 
with . a three..;.way tie for. the 

1 
league lead among the Pied 

1 Pipers, Sumner. Gold and 
Sumner Purple. 111e Trojans, 
from Fife, • are lurking only 
one-game behin.d the leadeI"s 
and wiU get a crack at the 
front - runners in upcoming 
contests. 

Wednesday's contest be­
tween Hi-Ho· Don's arid Har­
mon•. s Rental at.Stadium play­
ed a big• role· in the .outcome 
of the tight Western Washing­
ton League race, Hi-Ho took 
a one-game advantage into.the 
game, the third against sec­
ond - place Harmon's during 
the campaign. 

WESTERN WASHINGTON 
W L PF PA 

Hi-Ho Don's . 8 1 847 803 
Harmon' s 7 2 851 704 
Mullan•s 5 4 747 744 
Citizens St, Bk, I 7 502·568 
Precision Mac. 1 8 640 768 

THURSDAY - .Citizens State 
Bank vs. Hi-Ho Don's, 7, Puy­
allup Memorial: Mullan' s vs. 
Precision Machine, 8:30, Puy­
allup MemoI"ial. 

SENIOR BOYS 
Pied Pipers 5 2 270 247 
Sumner Gold 5 2 307 278 
Sumner PuI"ple 5 2 369 260 
Trojans 4 3 253 242 
UP Boosters 3 4 281 315 
Cardinals 3 3 124 127 
L. w. Lake rs 2 4 266 308 
Bethel 67ers 0 7 207 300 

COUNTY Al\llERICAN 
Wes1s. S.M. 5 l 347'310 
Malcom• s 5 l 382 325 
Volunteers 3 2 312 322 
Bird.' s Const, · 3 3 407 425 
Villa Thrift, 3 3 39 2 401 
Coffee House 2 .. 4 314334 
McNeil 2 3 297 321 
Stud Olde. 0 6 328 391 

COUNTY NATIONAL 
G0 H. Merch. 6 0 361 336 
Tacoma Trail. 4 1 310 254 
Hi-Hat Tav. 4 i 323 273 
Atlas-Bratrud 2 3 283 294 
Summit View 2 3 269 282 
Allison, In:c, 2 4 361 387 
Supreme Dairy 1 4 251 323 
McKinley Tav. O 5 205 334 

THURSDAY - McKinley 
Ave. Tavern vs,SummitView, 
8;30, Keithley: Gig Harber 
Merchants vs. Tacoma 'Ii:'ail­
er, 8:30, Mann:Atlas-Bratrud 
vs. Hi-Hat Tavern, 7, Mann. 

112th and 
Canyo11 

Road 

. SUMMIT VIEW OFFICE 
" ~Enox l-~322 

Member Fedefia l)ep'Qsit rnsi~rance Corporation 

they outscored second place 
Auburn 104 - 88, AubuI"n, 
Franklin Pierce and Renton 
each qualified six. in the PSL 
tourney. 

Meanwhile North Timrston 
w on the Seamount League 
tourney at Fife last weekend 
by eding Fife 118-94. Thurs­
ton 'placed nine entries into 
this week' s District while Fife 
had eight. Bethel added two 
and Sumner one for the other 
area schoolberths~ 

Franklin.· Pierce earned six 
places in the district and fin­
ished fifth in team standings 
in the pSL tourney, 

Qualifying for the Cards 
were Terry Beckstead, 115; 
Ron Reding, 123, Gary Simon, 
136; Bob Blessing, 141 : Gary 
Stevenson, 168; and Gary 
Hammer, 194, 

Meanwhile in the Seamount 
loop tourney Bethel placed two 
into the District with Randy 
Staab earning a 130 pound 
division berth and Dave Rice 
a place in the 178poundgroup. 

Four Viks won champion­
ships including Bob Joslin in 
the 123 pound bracket; Dave · 
Bressler, .. 178 pound; Erin 
Haynes, 194; and MarvTI1om­
pson, unlimited. Haynes and 
Thompson won theirs .on pins. 
Other Viks to earn District 
spots yvere Dave Harrington, 
106, Rich Fithen, 136; Dore 
ClausnitzeI", 148; jerry Daw­
son, 157, and Larry Lindsaw, 
168. 

Fife had four championships 
in the Seamount tournament 
with Dan Knodel, 115: Marv 
Query, .123, Doug WandeI"y, 
194; and Bill Looney, unlimit­
ed, winning· crowns. Other 
'Ii:'ojans earning District ber­
ths were jack Markam, 136; 
Pete Yamamoto, 148; Rich 
Kittinger, 157; Louis Boitano, 
168, and Bob Johnson, 178. 

Sumner• s entry is Pa u 1 
Staeheli earned his spot by 
winning the l36 pound divi­
sion, 

TEAM SCORING-Puyallup 104, Auburn 
88. Renton 62. Hlghllne 48, Franklin 
Pierce .iS, Clover Park _44, Federal Way 
41r Kent-Meridian 35, lakes 18, Tyee 15, 
Glacier 9, Mount Rainier 5, Eve~green 2. 

Team Scorln!f-North Thurston 118, Fifa 
94; , Curtis 83, , Tumwater 78, Bethel 37, 
Sumner- 33, -White River 26. Foster 21, 
TehOma 17, Laughbon 10, Enumclaw 9, 
Penlnsultt 3. 

Sportsmen Reset 

Steelheod Derby 

For This Sunday 
SUMNER - 111e Sumner 

Sportsmen's Club is sponsor­
ing a steelheau derby Sunday 
for fish caught on that day 
only. 

The deadline for weighing 
in is 2:30 p.m. at the Alder­
ton Clubhouse. 

Prizes will bd a warded by 
weight and judging done by 
club members only. 

Sandwiches and coffee will 
be available at the clubhouse. 

s1 
61,:.c.1 

DOWN 
Any car on 016 lot 

Price & Payment 
are on every cw 

Late models to clioose from 

UtHlED MOTORS 
8818 Pacafi i: Ave. 

GR; 4,.8418 

1i;;uff·~;-i;· The Cards I 
PARKLAND - After last 

· week's heartbI"eaking loss to 
Clover Park and a rough road 
trip to Auburn last night, tl1e 
Franklin Pierce CaI"dinals 
hope to salvage one morevic­
tory in southern division PSL 
play when they travel to Lakes 
Friday. 

Both clubs are suffering 
thI"ough dismal seasons, the 
Cards notching only 2 wins in 
league action and the Lancers 
yet to find their first victory.· 
About the best Franklin Pierce 
can hope for will be a 4th 
place finish when the season 
ends next week with a home 
game against front runner 
Puyallup, 

In last Friday's action, a 
last gasp tip in by Al Bulger 
that wo1,1ld have knotted the 
score in regulation play was 
declared to have come after 

FP Students 
To Meet 
Faculty Five 

The Franklin Pierce stu-
. dent-faculty game, sponsored 

by Pep Club, will be held Feb. 
21 at 7:30 p.m. in the high 
school gym. b 

This will be a benefit game 
to raise money fol" the new 
visitors' football bleachers to 
be built sometime in the fu­
tuI"e. Admission will_ be 35¢ 
pet" peI"son. 

The student team will be 
made .up of Lettermen, exclud­
ing vaI"sity basketball players, 
The faculty team will consist 
of teacher volunteers. 

Coronation of tl1e basket­
ball-wrestling queen will take 
place at the game. 

Nominations for the queen 
are seniors Pat Purdue, Pat 
Neishiern, Jo Carol Johnson, 
Marlene Smith, Arlene Ar­
rington, Pam Fauske, Kelli 
Taylor, Donna Fauske and Ca­
rol PaI"cheta. 

L ind a French, Lou Ann 
Clark, Sue Sharp and Sue Meir 
aI"e nominations for junior 
pl"incess. 

Sophomore princess nomin­
ations are Holly Hartwell, 
Sandy Archer, Sue Wilson, 
Adrian Rayesky and Pat Ben­
der. 

111e faculty coach will be 
Mr. Walter Galusha. KenMau­
erman will be "organizer" of 
tl1e lettermen team. 

Referees will be two college 
students. 

Mrs. Sharon Erickson, Miss 
Nancy Kleinschmidt and may­
be Mrs. Nancy hamlin will be 
tl1e faculty cheerleaders, 

Half - time entertainment 
wi:l be provided by Pep Club. 

the buzzer, giving Clover Park 
a slim 56-54 win. The Cards 
had come from far back late 
in the 3rd quarter and put on a · 
blistering last period attack 
d1at almost nipped the falter• 
ing W ardor quintet. 

Pierce' s Dennis ·Satterlee 
garnered high point• honors 
with 16, followed by team mate 
Jim Hadland's 14, Bulger 
contributed 9 counters • The 
WarrioI"s came up with a bal­
anced scoringattackthatfound 
four starters cashing in 47 
points, 

CLOVER PK. 156) 
lg ft pl Ip 

McOonld 5 2 2 12 
Mcinnis 5 2 1 12 
Connaway 1 . 0 3 2 
Stemper A 4 1 12 
Berg 43111 
Mockey 3 1 2 7 

FR. PIERCE (54, 
fgftpf!JI 

Bulger 4 1 A. 9 
J.Hadland 6 3 2 15 
Armstrng 1 2 i 
Satterlee 7 2 3 
G.Hadlnd l O l 2 
Eklund O O o O 
Harris O O 1 O 
Smith 4 0 0 8 
Furlong o o o O 

Totals 22 12 10 56 TO!SI!. 23 8 n54 
C:over Park ......... 19 11 19 8"-'56 
Franklin .Pierce l4 12 13 ].S.-,..:.54 

Free throws missed! Frankltn Pierce_ 8, 
Clover Park 6. 

Shots attempted: Franklin Pierce 52, 
Clover Park .42. 

Rebounds; Franklin Pierce ~S, Clover 
Park 20. 

Reserve sc:ore: Cfover Park. M; Frank~ 
Jin Pierce 36, 

Spa1ru:111111R11y Stocks 

Boness lo 
Promote ARI 
'67 Schedule 

SPANAWAY -Acourrruling 
in Pierce C o u n t y SupeI"ior 
Court last week by Judge john 
Cochran gave DickBonessand 
Auto Racing Incorporated the 
green light to promote all 
stock car races at Spanawa} 
Speedway this year. Contracts 
have been signed and the popu-

lar stocks will kick off the 1 67 
season on Easter Sunday, 
March 26th. 

The 1966 ARI membership 
listed 325 drivers, with a 
weekly turnout at Spanaway 
averaging 40 to 50 cars. With 
a new addition of the "claimer" 
cl.i.ss this year, membership 
should reach an all-time high. 

A general membership 
meeting has been set at Span­
away .American Legion Hall, 
160th and Park Avenue for 
Tuesday, February 21st •. The 
meeting will get underway at 
8:00 p.m. and will include 
movies of '66 ARI race action 
taken by Al Cavelti. All mem­
bers are reminded that 167 
cards must be obtained be­
fore entering the pits on open­
ing day. Cards and rules can 
be obtained by writing AR.I 
headquarters, 710 So, 132nd 
Street or calling LE 1-4°'•4 

E 
Tacoma's Newest 
Rambler Dealer 

·FOR YOUR SE·RVICE 

Car Rentals Available 
SERVICE HOURS: 

Mon. through Fri., 8 a.m •. to 5 p.m. 

''COMI SEE US" 

EGAN 
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Paradise Bowling 

Betsy Cooley broke 200 and 
600 for the first time last 
week in Last Niters' action at 
Paradise Bowl. 

Betsy had games of 223, 
187 and 197 for a 602 and two 
new marks for her in tl1e sport. 

In other action last week: 

PINNED. Sumner's Paul Staeheli is just about ready to get 
the ref's tap for a pin against Curtis grappler Rich Carbone 
in sub district action at Fife High School last Friday night. 

Staeheli also earned a 4-0 decision in his match Saturday 
night. 

PARKLAND MIX: Lela Na­
rucci 528, 'I11elma Thornhill 
197, Bob Lovelace 557, Bob 
White 222. 

850 SCRATCH: Bud Seaman 

WE ST AND to lose a lot of 
c1ur hunting and fishing spots 
in this state because a girl 
tripped over a sprinkler on tl1e 
lawn of a Savings and Loan 
Company - unless we get busy 
and contact ·our legislators. 

A Costly Trip 
for Sportsmen 
May Be Result 
Sound crazy? It is, but it 

could happen, Here's why. The 
girl was on her way to one of 
the public meeting rooms 
banks make available for use 
by people in tl1e community 
they serve. She fell, was hurt, 
sued, and when all the appeals 
were finished, the Supreme 
Court ruled she could collect 
damages! 

How does that affect our ac­
cess to hunting and fishing 
spots? 

Sad but true, on the basis 
of that decision, if a hunter or 
fisherman should trip over a 
coil of barbed wire by a fence 
or step in a hole in a field 
and be hurt while using some 
fl!t'mer' s land, he could sue 
and stand a good chance of col­
lecting. 

So put yourself in tl1e farm­
er's shoes. Would you let 
hunters and fishermen come 
onto your land? If you' re a 
private timber company which 
lets hundreds of thousands of 
hunters and fishermen use 
your land, would you maybe 
take a new look at letting all 
those possible law suits run 
around tripping over ruts in 
logging roads? 

Viks Could 
Clinch Crown 

PUYALLUP - Depending on 
how they fared on the hostile 

of Clover Park last 
the high riding Puyallup 

cagers could wrap up 
' 11 e PSL Southern Division 
·ro,;.,n with a victory over Fed­
.;'al Way tomorrow night in a 

hpme encounter. 
\he Warriors of CP are not-

for their race horse brand 
hall, especially in tl1e spa­

confines of their own 
Many league coaches 

the fact a 10 point 
advantage is more like 

when the schedule takes 
to Warrior country. 

W eyerha1111ser Reports 568, Sonny Bowman 220. 
CLASSIC: Don Hardwick 

598-254, Bob White 598. 
EVERGREEN: Elmer Doy-

Hunters Took 8,200 Elk, 
1Deer From Company L d le 556, Orv Swinn 208. · an BOWLERETTES: Rose Ev­

eleth 546, Robbin Garrett 202. 

'I11is St!preme Court deci­
sion, as wacky as it may sound, 
is still tl1e decision. Like an 
umpire calling balls and strik­
es, it may have been called 
wrong from where we're sit­
ting, but it still stands. 

So here's what we can do. 
A new law, limiting tl1is lia­
bility of landowners in our 
state' is in the making in 
Olympia. It passed,tl1e House 
with a huge majority, but then 
wound up in tl1e Judiciary 
Commitree of the Senate, 
where some would like to see 
it buried. 

And you better believe it, it 

could die right d1ere. Some 
Olympia lobbyists, who make 
their living working in the 
world of politics, feel there' s 
a good chance it might just do 
that. 

We should let our legisla­
tors know right now that we 
want this bill, HB 258, passed. 
It's our hunting and fishing 
that will suffer, it's the coop­
erative landowner who leJ's us 
use his land who will suffer .. 
when someone sues and col­
lects. 

The bill is not a parti!lan 
one. It has Republican and 
Democratic backers, but 
needs our help now. 'I11is is 
a gut issue for us who enjoy 
hunting and fishing, for more 
game is killed on private land 
in this state tl1an on govern­
ment land. 

Phone, wire or 
legislator, Now. 

* * * 

write your 

WHAT do you do when ice 
freezes in the guides of your 
steeU1ead or ice fishing rod? 

Some intrepid souls put the 
guide in their mouth and melt 
the ice that way. If it isn't 
too cold, you can dunk your 
entire rod in the river. TI1e 
water, being above freezing, 
will take the ice away. Both 
of these methods mean your 
guides will ice up again soon 
and you have to do it all over 
again. 

One of the better methods 
is to put a drop of glycerin 
in the e'ye of each guide. 
This will keep it free for some 
time. A small bottle of gly­
cerin with an eye dropper 
built into tl1e cap sill take up · 
little room in a tackle box or 
fishing vest and pay big divi­
dends during freezing wea­
ther, 

Hunters harvested 5,422 
deer and 2,779 elk on Weyer­
haeuser Company's Washing­
ton forest lands during the 
1966 season, according to 
eompliations just completed 
by company game biologists 
and foresters b 

Indications a re that elk 
herds are increasing and deer 
population is holding fairly 
steady on the forest products 
company's Western Washing­
ton tree farms. 

While deer tend to concen­
trate in recently logged areas, 

the average harvest was 
slightly more than two deer 
per square mile, based on an 
estimate of 1,687 ,293 acres 
of Weyerhaeuser land as deer 
range. Using the yardstick of 
"man - days" (one hunter a­
field for one day equals one 
man-day) the company was 
host to 56,900 man-days of 
deer hunting, and it took about 
10-1/2 man-days of hunting to 
bag each deer. 

'I11e elk harvest exceeded 
three per square mile for the 
first time on an estimated 
588,933 acres of elk range. 
Game biologists estimate the 
annual elk harvest at about 20 
per cent of the herds. 'I11is 
would put the pre-season elk 
population at nearly 14,000 
animals, up from an estimat­
ed 11,000 two years ago. 

Besides big game, 255 bears 
and 4, 418 grouse were report­
ed taken on Weyerhaeuser 
land. 

Virtually all of the firm's 
forest land in Washin(';ton and 
Oregon was open on weekends 

Spartan Five 
To Resume 
Cage Wars Fri 

SUMNER - After a week's 
respite from Seamount League 
cage action, tl1e Sumner Spar­
tans will hit the boards and 
the road again Friday for a 
trip to North Thurston t0 help 
settle a three-way third-place 
tic. 

Seemingly settled in tl1e 
first division, the Spartans 
arc tied with Bethel and Nortl1 

. 'I1rnrston with a 6-3 record. 
But Foster and Curtis are 
only a half game behind them 
with a 6-4 record and Tum­
water a single game behind 
with 5-4. 

WANT A BARGAIN ????? 
YOUR PRESENT HOME IS JUST THAT 

ON TODAYS MARKET 

ADD A ROOM-REMODEL-REPAIR-INST ALL ~ NEW 
KITCHEN IN YOUR PRESENT HOME AND ENJOY 
PRESENT ·DAY COMFORT ~ND PLEASURE WITH 
YESTERDAYS LOW COST INVESTMENT. 

. Cal I 11s for Information and Estimates 

\.VAUGHAN'S PACI Fie 

; AV El1U.!.E 
84th & f>ACIFIC AVENUE, 

LUMBER INC: 
GJt!; E~J'lf;J-.IL+<J_!i ! 5.' 

,;F 

througl1out the season, with 
much of it also open during 
the week. Weekday closures 
were necessary in areas of 
active logging operations. 

Officials said public hunt­
ing access to company land 
last fall was, as usual, not 
witl10ut some problems, al­
tl1ough in g;eneral, hunter con­
duct showed marked improve-
ment over some previous 
years. Financial losses re­
sulting from vandalism, thelt 

and vehicle damage to wet 
roads totaled P, 478 in Wash-· 
ington and $3, 760 in Oregon. 

Washington nirnrods racked 
up an excellent record ol' co­
operation on fire prevention 
last fall with not a single 
blaze attributed to hunters 
reported on Weyerhaeuser 
land. In Oregon IO hunter­
caused fires burned over a 
total of five acres of company 
land. 

Bethel Braves 
Face Trojans 
At Fife Friday 

'I11e Braves will be tryin)'; 
to hold on tu their share of 
tldnJ place in the Seamoulll 
League Friday wyen tliey tra­
vel to Fife to meet tl1e Tro-
jans. 

Bethel stayed in a tJ1rce­
way tic with Stimner and Nortl1 
Thursday tl1is week after 
dumping Enumclaw 62-42 last 
Friday night. 

Ketter with 18, Dolfin witl1 
15 and Dukes witl1 l ·t sparked 
Bed1el1 s attack, whicl1 rolled 
up a 34-20 halftime lead. 

STANDINGS MONDAY 

Peninsula 
Mount Si 
Bethel 
Sumner 
N, Thurston 
Foster 
Curt:is 
Tumwater 
'Fife 
Enumclaw 
Tahoma 
Laughbon 
White River 

W L PF PA 
9 1 664 470 
8 2 613 495 
6 :i 479 420 
6 3 478 389 
6 3 602 536 
6 4 614 589 
6 4 524 551 
5 4 475 480 
4 s 526 495 
2 8 511 591 
2 8 506 617 
l 8 333 591 
l ') 494 595 

·L 

FIREMEN: George Leigh 
593-209. 

LAST NITERS: Walt Dan­
iel 59'1, J crry Sweet 210, Bet­
sy Cooley 602-223, 

4XS1S: Fred Miller 551-
209, Aggie Saindon 530-214. 

B1\NTAMS: (2 games) Mark 
Miller 257, Laren Ky!lo 151, 
Dixie Cannon 240, Barbara 
Unkrur 125. 

JUNIORS: Bill Gibson 571-
223, Betty llnkrur 425-167. 

EXPRESS: Del Miller 550, 
Les Tatro 220, Lois Reeves 
495, Loretta Crone 175. Arm­
eta Tatro - step ladder 112-
111-110. 

BETHEL: Daryl Thaut 551, 
Bob Anderson 206, Pa~Smelt­
zcr 499-180, 

LITTLr: LUTES: Dennis 
Lee 516-205, Marcia Allen 
442-189. 

ROLLING BrmS: Mary Pa­
ton 544-201, Virginia 'I11eno 
201. 

BELLES: / Ellen !Craiger 
558-210. . ' 

PlNr':TTJ·:s: l".ilccn Andrea­
son 571-222, St1e Sweaney 550, 
11ran Sieler 54:l, Sandy Eve­
rett 222. 

l'Al{KLAND MERCHANTS: 
Bill Wold 603, John Ehly 241. 

SPORTSMAN: Lars Larson 
617-2:l'1. 

INDUSTRIAL: .Jim Brand­
fu,; S:l6, l(ay Wing 202. 

Tlll·:s. N!TE MIX: Dick 
Drcon 561-240, Detty Breon 
'16l, 'I1wlma Thornhill 177. 

PREMH::R: Bob Devereaux 
616, Don llat·dwick 607, Frank 
Burklund 606, Dick Devereaux 
Sr. 604, Al Ausbun 601, Rud 
Pardey 2:i2. 

LADIES SCRATCH TRIOS: 
Gertie Hicli 564, Mary Paton 
547, Geneva Barlow 543, Lou 
Johnson 212. 

SR. C!TlZt,:N: Ray l'itts 546, 
Al Kleinsasser 202, Cora Zac­
harias 509-180. 

FRANKLIN PIERCE FACU­
LTY: Larry Carlson 559, Skip 
Larsen 215, Eleanor Ervin 
487, Grace Swan 189. 

MIXERS: john Boyce 547-
215, Sydney Sheppard 549-201. 

TOP ROLLERS: Dick Henn­
ing 570-204, Jeanne Hocking 
520-201, All Spare Game Dick 
Henning 183. 

GRAHAM: john Ehly 546, 
Bob Bjornstad 213, Emma 
Ehly 486, Rita Ockfen 203. 

I • 
AT THESE PRICES 

1957 FORD Hardtop, sharp, New Motor,. • }5_25· 
1959 CHEV 2 Door Sedan ••••.••••• J395 
1961 VALIANT '4 Door ••.•••••..•• '$495 
1959 STU DE Lark, ••••• , •• , ••••••• $295 

Many Other Outstanding Buys! 
LOW DOWN PAYMENTS. 

We Do Our Own financingl 

A&G MOTORS 
11455 PACIFIC AVE .. 

LE 1-0342 
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EAGER BEAVERS: Dorothy 
Davis 523-217. 

BIRDS OF PARADISE; Mar­
ie Harrison 517, Rose Moore 
203. 

I-Il - LOWS: Donna Nyblod 
.477, Marian Unkrur 193. Step 
Ladders: Sharon Lodge 92-

. 112-132; Sharon Helmka 106-
105-104. 
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atson's e OS 
by Em Matson 

Robin Hood ne,ver had itthis good! 
That's what sporting goods dealer Darrel Deritis 

says about the new 18 foot archery range recently 
installed in his Pacific Avenue store. It seems 
modem b(>wmen like to try a bow for proper sight­
ing before making a dedsion. If such sophisti­
cation in bow and arrow accuracy were available 
100 years ago maybe one of Sitting Bull's relatives 
would be.President today. 

*** 
Sketches of the 1967 Franklin Pierce daffodil float 

arc . on display • at Parkland Light and Water, 404 
Garfield Street, along with the trophy for last year's 

· entry. The float will feature a functional ferris 
wheel, and a merry,..go-round. 

*** 
Andy Egan recently opened Pierce Cpunty's new­

est Rambler agency at 8223 Pacific Avenue. He .has 
been associated with Rambler sales the past 10 
years and a resident of the area since 1954. His 
sales staff will be made up of sales manager Dick 
Larson and salesmen Bob Huber, Earl Bauer, Bob 
.Shelman and Wally. Adams. Butch Sterbenz will be 
service manager, "Andy Egan Rambler will pro.., 
mote customer satisfaction by providing a basic 
policy. fairness to all," the. new owner slates. 

A hearty welcome lo.John' 
Keeler, Mayfair's new ma­
nager for Park. 'N Shop 
Market. Be recently moved 
to the area from Eugene, 
Oi·egon, where he man­
aged a Mayfair store. Good 
luck .John in your new as­
signment. 

*** 

Congralulations arc in orclc r for .\ rms1xong 
Horn.cs, which recently cclcbralccl it.'> first anni­
vct'i;ary in. the Parkland area. The l'il' rec Cotmly 
branch at11319 Pacific Avenue is ma11aged by Bob 
~md ,Tim Person. 

*** 

United Motors, 8818 Pacific AvcnuL·, i::; a new 
addition to the Pacifie .f\ ve. used car lots. f\1 , 
Torel1i, >top hand in the operation, will be assist-' 
ed by Tom Cmicr. 

SHOE Cl.lAIANCE SALE 
STH WEEK • PRICE CUTS TO 80% 

STORE WIDE SAU ·SAVE NOW! 
SAMPLE PRICES 

WOMEN'S UTILITY SHOES··SIIES AA & AAA ONLY 
COMFORTABLE ROUND TOE REG. 14.00 · PR. 2.99 

Men's Best Grade Leathe·r-top Rubber 
Bottom Pacs, Warm & Waterproof Reg. IS PR. 7.50 
Boy's 8 inch boot-genuine Goodyear Welt PR. 6.99 

elsewherl:! 10 .• 88 
Children's Shoes PR. 2.99 

PA.UL'S SHOES 
161. st & Pad fie 
LE 7-0552, 

Open 9 to 9 Daily 
Ti II 6 Sat, & Sunday 

L Tl ES 
You've Heard About'em ! 

You've read obout'em! 

'\' 

TINY HAS;'EM 

DUNLOP 
S.P. Radial 

Ply.Tires 

TINY'S 
TIRE CENTER 

108.TH & Pacific 
LE 1-4535 
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Large Sunkist Cello 20 Lbs .. No .. 2 Chiquita 

Oranges Carrots Potatoes Bananas 

Lb. 
c c 1 


